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Generic

Name Page Price Quantity

Camouflage hooded crop
hoodie

5 0.99

Autumn And Winter New
Women's Clothing Sunken
Stripe Stitching Plaid
Lace-up Dress

2 5.49

autumn winter fur fur
collar shawl cardigan wool
coat

2 24.25

Black Cherry Summary
Crop Top Tee Kawaii Shirt
Women

3 1.06

Black High Waist Tight
Leather Pants

3 11

Black Hole Jeans Skinny
Plus Size Pants

4 8

Camisole women's v-neck
solid color tube top
sleeveless bottoming top

4 3.18

Casual Cotton Striped
Spaghetti Straps Jumpsuit

5 2.25

Casual Fringed Ripped
Loose Denim Jacket

6 25.18

Casual Sleeveless Hollow
Lace Vest

6 11.91



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

CIAO Letter Graphic Crew
Neck Sweater

7 19.37

Clothing Sleeve Crop Top
Casual Letter Shirt t-Shirts

7 1.17

Contrast Plaid Turtleneck
Sweater Top

8 15.84

Cotton Linen Shirt Plus
Size Ladies Button Loose
Long Sleeve Casual Shirt
Women Tops

8 7.43

Cropped Sexy Crop Top
Solid Color Camisole
Babes

9 2.95

Cross-border New
Summer Short-sleeved T-
Shirt Women's Design
Sense, Short High-Waist
Crop Top, Fashionable
Loose Women's Clothing

9 0.62

Cute Tortoise Pendant
Copper Plated 18K Gold
Necklace Female Clavicle
Chain Jewelry

10 4.6

Denim Jumpsuit Loose
Fashion Elastic Mid Waist
Jumpsuit Women's Pants

10 24.23

Double-sided brushed
nude high waist, buttocks,
abdomen, yoga clothes,
nine-point pants

11 17.39

Drawstring Knit Paneled
Chiffon Top Feminine Top
European and American

11 11.67

Elegant Autumn-Winter
Polyester Party Dress with
Dropped Shoulder
Sleeves

12 17.21

Ethnic style sweet
contrast color striped vest
halter neck sling vest top

12 8.16

European and American
camouflage yoga pants
women's double-sided
nude printing yoga pants

13 17.22
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www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

European and American
sexy tights white sexy bra

13 1.93

European And American
Split Bikini Swimsuit
Printing High Waist Sexy

14 2.46

European And American
Style Lace Diamond Sexy
Cutout Steel Ring
Fishbone Slim Fit Crop-
top Short Top

14 1.24

European and American
style new women's French
design embroidery print
dress

15 20.61

European And American
Suit Women's Leopard
Print Short Sleeve Lining
Summer Shorts Two-
piece Set

15 4.46

Fashion casual pleated
quick-drying tennis anti-
exposure sports skirt
pants

16 16.84

Fashion crop top 16 1.46

Fashion Plaid Women's
Coat Sweater Stitching

17 4.41

Fashion Super Elastic
Texture Print Tight Casual
High Waist Slim Ninth
Pants

17 12.96

Fashion Women's Knitted
Vest Sleeveless Pocket
Casual Pullover Vest

18 16.53

Fashion women's printed
long sleeve dress

18 20.59

Fashionable and elegant
animal print sexy backless
suspender dress

19 17.1

Fashionable and sexy
sleeveless knitted
embroidered woolen vest

19 14.53



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Fashionable printed
casual resort style
cardigan shorts suit

20 16.87

Fashionable sexy
suspender tube top slim fit
pleated shorts suit

20 13.21

Fashionable sports yoga
pants with high waist,
tummy control and butt lift,
peach butt fitness pants

21 19.5

Fashionable women's new
style lapel zipper sweater
dress

21 27.97

Female Satin Slim V-Neck
Sexy Camisole Crop Top

22 3.16

Feminine U-neck tie-back
long-sleeved dress

22 22.7

Flower print hot diamond
shoulder tank top

23 3.02

Geometric print
fashionable new
suspender wide-leg
casual elastic pants suit

23 19.5

German traditional
clothing Bavaria
Oktoberfest Ding Dong
costume white shirt

24 2.64

Halloween Elastic Slim Fit
Sports Tight Leggings

24 10.81

High Waist Belly
Contracting Yoga Pants
Women's Sports Tight

25 6

High Waist Pants Hip Lift
Yoga Fitness Pants
Elastic Waist Slim Ninth
Pants

25 17.52

Hip lift fitness pants High
waist tight yoga pants

26 16.2

Hollow backless tight
short-sleeved navel half-
high collar solid color hot
girl sexy T-shirt

26 9
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www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Inner bottoming vest fixed
chest pad high breathable
vest

27 2.26

Knit Sweater Woman With
Thick Thread, Long
Sleeves And High Neck
Pullover

27 23.74

Lace long-sleeve new top
V-neck sexy women's
clothing

28 11.81

Ladies Bright Diamond
Tassel Wrap Chest Tank
Top

28 8.64

Ladies Elegant Classic
Beer Festival Regular
Bottoming Lace Stitching
Sexy Underwear Shirt

29 2.64

Ladies Elegant Classic
Halloween Beer Festival
Regular Lace Bottoming
Shirt

29 2.72

Ladies new holiday casual
crochet flower suspender
dress

30 18.14

Ladies new solid color
corduroy overalls

31 24.37

Ladies new solid color
sleeveless stitching dress

31 12.17

Ladies Stitching Hip
Lifting High Waist
Sweatpants Yoga Pants

32 10.6

Ladies' Loose Strap
Fashion Sexy Slim Tank
Top

30 6.85

Linen Turn-down Collar
Sweet Enough Striped
Button Up Top

32 19.23

Long Sleeve V Neck
Pullover Women's
Sweater Top

33 3.63

Loose-fitting low-rise
casual pants, hot girl
drape knitted wide-leg
trousers

33 13.75
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Name Page Price Quantity

Low-cut backless metallic
suspender dress

34 14.63

Men's Polo Collar Solid
Color Long-sleeved
Sports

34 6.3

New all-match thin denim
short-sleeved shirt casual
top

35 19.7

New American Denim
Overalls Casual Pocket
Shorts Elastic Waist

35 21.4

New arrival printed ruffled
wide-leg trousers with slits

36 15.54

New beach dress solid
color sexy knitted hollow
bikini swimsuit cover up
sun protection clothing

36 16.32

New button round neck
ribbed simple casual
ladies t-shirt top

37 15.68

New camisole hollow solid
color vacation vest

37 9.41

New camisole wide
shoulder strap sexy slim
hot girl sleeveless top

38 8.42

New casual solid color
one shoulder waist top

38 3.52

New casual suspender
slim fit patchwork navel-
baring solid color tank top
T-shirt

39 7.05

New Casual Wrap
Sleeveless Printed Shirt

39 12

New coat button plaid
printed small suit women's
mid-length coat

40 21.45

New comfortable casual
vest open vest

40 18.96



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

New Commuting Solid
Color V-Neck Waist Puff
Sleeve Swing Dress

41 16.33

New contrast color
stitching sweatshirt
texture casual comfortable
V-neck stand collar
sweatshirt

41 18.13

New drawstring yoga
wear breathable solid
color running tights

42 19.59

New elastic high waist
seamless gradient pants
sports slimming tight yoga
pants

42 13.43

New elegant solid color
tube top dress

43 21.92

New Fashion Printed
Square Collar Waist-tight
Mid-sleeve Dress

43 1.78

New Fashion Sexy
Embroidered Suspender
Dress

44 19.64

New Fashion Sexy
Sequined Strap Square
Neck Backless Dress
Dress

44 30.82

New fashionable and sexy
solid color knitted vest
backless strappy top

45 11.63

New fashionable button
placket lace back strap
vest top

45 12.35

New Fashionable Puff
Sleeve Striped T-Shirt

46 11.05

New fashionable ruffled
floral camisole vest

46 7.65

New Fashionable Slit
Party Loose Holiday
Dress

47 16.99

NEW HALTER BRALET
CROP TOP

47 0.76
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Name Page Price Quantity

New hollow lace 2-piece
dress

48 23.64

New lace satin sweet slim
buttoned small camisole

48 17.87

New lace stitching sling
jumpsuit sexy slim halter
bodysuit

49 12.98

New lace stitching solid
color T-shirt dress

49 16.3

New lantern sleeve V-
neck top, vacation style
sexy navel-baring strappy
shorts set

50 18.02

New love hollow navel-
baring sweater holiday top

50 3.58

New motorcycle style
short lapel jacket

51 40.26

New multi-color yoga
sports tight trousers

51 15.62

New Navel Sports Trend
Pajamas Tie-dyed Home
Wear Suit

52 2.65

New one-shoulder striped
short-sleeved dress

52 18.34

New peach yoga high
waist hip lifting leggings
and flared pants

53 16.81

New retro square neck
pleated slim high waisted
short vest halter top

53 11.96

New ripped jeans 54 6.8

New seamless solid color
knitted high elastic yoga
pants running sports
fitness pants

54 12.94
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Name Page Price Quantity

New sequined solid color
casual vest

55 8.69

New sexy all-match halter
neck sequin vest party
nightclub babes women's
clothing

55 6.26

New sexy holiday print
tube top shawl two-piece
set

56 16.25

New sexy slim fit
sleeveless lace tank top
T-shirt

56 7.2

New Sexy Small V-neck
Hollow Lace Jumpsuit

57 3.83

New Simple Cable V-neck
Solid Color Sweater Vest

57 16.45

New Simple Hooded
Cable Solid Color
Cardigan Sweater

58 19.75

New Simple Round Neck
Long Sleeve Hollow
Sweater

58 18.09

New simple solid color
long-sleeved T-shirt color
matching contrast casual
home tops

59 14.24

New simple thin short
casual wool cardigan

59 17.65

New Simple Zipper Half-
open Striped Lapel Vest

60 18.3

New single-breasted
square collar sleeveless
tops slim fit hip sexy
women's fashion two-
piece suit

60 22.53

New sleeveless hot girl
street shooting sexy tube
top top

61 9.58

New solid color hollow
navel-exposing lace hip
dress

61 14.24
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Name Page Price Quantity

New solid color lace-up
elastic waist trousers
simple temperament
commuter tapered
trousers

62 16.98

New solid color mid-collar
women's tops

62 12.06

New solid color pullover
V-neck dress

63 18.33

New solid color resort
fashion jumpsuit

63 19.45

New solid color round
neck slim fit inner midriff-
baring long-sleeved short
T-shirt

64 2.65

New split skirt style sexy
high waist suspender
bikini hot spring resort
style bikini

64 17.06

New spring and summer
fashionable commuter suit
sleeveless vest and shorts
suit

65 24.87

New straight leg loose
sweatpants wide leg pants
outdoor dance casual
trousers

65 17.32

New style brushed striped
knitted skirt long sleeve
pleated patchwork dress

66 14.97

New style denim lace
work dress casual mid
length skirt trendy

66 25.14

New style floral print
suspender dress

67 17.95

New style knitted tube top
camisole with decorative
buttoned blouse inside

67 6.06

New style lace
embroidered fishbone
sexy tube top suspender
hollow backless outer bra

68 12.59
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New style lace slope neck
cardigan loose splicing
backless lace-up solid
color top

68 12.03

New style lace splicing
short-sleeved T-shirt V-
neck casual and
comfortable top

69 12.8

New style off-shoulder
short contrast color
contrast color print wide-
leg pants two-piece set

69 19.98

New Style Ring European
Retro Zircon Inlaid
Diamond Ring

70 3.46

New style simple casual
versatile vest with bow
decorative top

70 9.23

New style temperament
tube top gradient dress

71 16.32

New stylish and sexy
bubble wave high waist
slim dress

71 16.2

New suspender print
dress INS loose holiday
casual elastic dress

72 18.22

New three-dimensional
embroidery sleeveless
stand collar lace stitching
dress

72 15.91

New Tie-dye Printed High
Elastic Tight Sports Pants

73 2.25

New Tie-dye Printed
Lace-up Tube Top Shorts
Suit

73 1.75

New Tie-dyed Printed
Hooded Cropped Sweater
For Women

74 1.12

New Tight-fitting Cotton
Crop Top Summer

74 1.29

New V-neck Sexy Hollow
Strappy Backless
Suspender Top

75 10.32
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Name Page Price Quantity

New women's casual
printed tube top dress

75 15.96

New Women's Clothing
New Fashion Contrast
Color Striped Vest

76 11.47

New women's fashion
knitted striped sleeveless
vest/trousers

76 13.32

New women's fashionable
and versatile slim fit satin
camisole

77 13.31

New women's fashionable
casual all-match lace-up
loose striped top

77 15.12

New women's fashionable
halterneck sexy low-cut
backless knitted hollow
see-through dress

78 17.28

New women's fashionable
slim solid color mesh
hollow see-through lace
long-sleeved cardigan

78 6.2

New women's floral hollow
pleated sleeveless high
waist dress

79 23.4

New women's fluffy
pleated hem sexy
backless V-neck
sleeveless suspender
dress

79 15.27

New women's hand-sewn
bow contrasting color
breathable sports
underwear with breast
pads

80 8.97

New Women's High Waist
Hip Pocket Yoga Pants

80 13.53

New women's hottie
houndstooth bow strap
temperament slim vest

81 9.81

New women's lace mesh
splicing suspenders see-
through backless sexy
short top

81 7.62
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Name Page Price Quantity

New women's lace mesh
suspender long dress

82 29.26

New women's lapel plush
short jacket

82 25.75

New women's loose solid
color fashionable lapel
coat

83 37.68

New women's niche
design outer wear long-
sleeved tops

83 3.39

New women's off-shoulder
lace bow long-sleeved T-
shirt

84 12.37

New women's puff sleeve
sexy floral navel cropped
top

84 6.18

New women's simple sexy
slim knitted skirt

85 16.06

New women's solid color
lapel tie pocket cardigan
three buttons mid-length
sweater coat

85 30.08

New women's solid color
short halter top

86 3.16

New Women's Solid Color
Short Sleeve

86 1.91

New women's solid color
single-breasted loose
dropped shoulder sleeve
knitted cardigan

87 23.68

New Women's V-neck
Holiday Coconut Tree
Print Sleeveless Vest Top
Trousers Set

87 19.73

New Women's V-neck
Long Sleeve Jumpsuit
High Waist Lace-up
Jumpsuit

88 26.1

New women's V-neck
patchwork lace top

88 13.52



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
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Name Page Price Quantity

New yoga tight-fitting
shoulder sleeve sports
jumpsuit shorts

89 15.5

Nude Feel Seamless
Slightly Flared Yoga
Pants Sports Running
Fitness Pants Female
High Waist Hip Lift Yoga
Pants

89 2.8

Off-shoulder long-sleeved
gathered midriff-baring
knit top

90 3.3

One-shoulder ruffled
trumpet sleeve ribbon
dress

90 16.77

Pentagram Geometry
Paste Cloth Embroidery
Hooded Cardigan
Sweater Men

91 9.53

Personalized wine glass
print Baby Tee navel-
baring short-sleeved
versatile T-shirt

91 2.45

Plus Size Solid Color
Women's Short Fur Coat

92 6.66

Plush Homewear Casual
3-piece Pajamas Long
Sleeve Navel Vest Shorts
Set

92 21.56

Polka dot print slip dress 93 19.75

Printed Halter Neck High
Waist Scheming Red
Temperament Commuter
Dress

93 17.37

Printed Pullover Slim Fit
Crew Neck Short T-Shirt
Crop Navel T-Shirt

94 2.25

Pure color sexy sequin slit
long skirt shirred one-
shoulder evening dress

94 14.97

Rainbow crop top 95 1.49
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Name Page Price Quantity

Retro workwear style
zipper belt decorated
short PU leather skirt

95 23.37

Romantic Cotton
Sleeveless Round Neck
Solid Vacation Dress

96 15.57

Seamless jacquard crop
top

96 1.54

Sequin Alphabet Print
Casual Skinny Short
Sleeve Simple Hong Kong
Style Crop Top

97 0.97

Sexy Crop Top Bottoming
Inner Wear Outer Wear
Top

97 0.5

Sexy deep V-neck
backless suspender dress
lace beach dress

98 12.97

Sexy hollow lace stitching
sports yoga leggings

98 9.88

Sexy hot girl's one-piece
collared long-sleeved
sweater

99 7.57

Sexy one-shoulder three-
dimensional floral long-
sleeved knitted top

99 7.04

Sexy short-sleeved V-
neck dress, bohemian
beach retro floral skirt

100 17.75

Sexy slim fit lace
drawstring long sleeve
bottoming shirt

100 3.18

Sexy V-neck leather
sleeveless short section of
a hundred halter matte
elastic pu undershirt top

101 3.19

Sexy Women Plain Basic
Stretch T- Shirts Crop Top
Sweater

101 2.07

Sexy women's abstract
dazzling dizzy ripple print
halter neck tie top

102 2.42
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Shredded jeans 102 9

Sleeveless crew neck
racer tank T-shirt

103 2.67

Slim short crop top 104 0.97

Sling outer wear small
vest with chest pad
beautiful back inner base

104 2.4

Slit Micro High Waist
Elastic Hip Lifting
Abdomen Dance Casual
Sports Trousers

105 20.34

Solid Color Backless High
Waist Bikini Split Swimsuit

105 2.94

Solid color inner and outer
wear slim-fit irregular
beautiful back tank top

106 2.6

Solid color letter bandage
cross crop top

106 1.24

Solid Color Short Sleeve
Round Neck Pullover Top

107 0.66

Solid Color Simple Slim
Polo Shirt Short Sleeve

107 2.83

Solid color slim fit twist
halter top

108 12.53

Solid color stand collar
cotton jacket with loose
pockets and long sleeves

108 27.71

Spice Girls Short Vintage
Abstract Printed Sleeve
Short Top

109 2.8

Spring and summer sexy
midriff-baring camisole

109 8.44
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Spring and summer
temperament commuting
V-neck five-quarter sleeve
top

110 16.3

Spring and summer
temperament slim solid
color camisole

110 10.7

Spring and summer
women's suspender cross
large V-neck backless
lace-up fashionable top

111 12.81

Spring Summer Ladies
Top Solid Color Short
Sexy Slim Cross Pleated
Vest

111 3

Stand Collar Casual
Cotton-padded Coat Short
Sports Cotton-padded
Jacket

112 11.45

Strap pajamas women's
long nightgown high-end
home service set

112 21.34

Summer Beach Vest
Printed Dress Plus Size
Women's Clothing

113 2.66

Summer New Hollow
Spice Girl Top Sexy Tight
Halter Neck Camisole

113 3.5

Summer New Women's
Wear Versatile Slim Fit
Letter Embroidery Sports
Tank Top

114 2.52

Summer Pure Color
Sequins Sleeveless Sexy
Round Neck Splicing
Sling Vest

114 1.9

Suspender Sleeveless V-
neck Leopard Snake Print
Dress Fashion Sexy Midi
Dress

115 11.99

Sweater spring new V-
neck drawstring crop
topKnit sweater pullover

115 1.05

Temperament cross-
border long sleeved small
suit jacket women's
versatile

116 19.24
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Temperament Leisure
Lace-up Shirt Women's
Clothing

116 3.77

Textured-leather high-
stretch yoga pants

117 19.79

Trendy cotton and linen
lazy style pure color
sleeveless suspenders
one-piece overalls for
women

117 17.7

V-neck halter chest bow
vest slim see-through
sexy backless top

118 7.76

V-neck loose casual
pullover women's sweater

118 18.95

Woman'S Autumn New
Temperament Off-The-
Shoulder High-Waist Sexy
Dress

119 23.64

Women's Slub Cotton
Women's Flared Sleeve
One-Line Neck Sexy Top

120 6.72

Women's A- Line
Umbrella Skirt High Waist
Midi Skirt

120 2.5

Women's All Over Floral
Print Holiday Slip Dress

121 20.29

Women's back -back band
sexy inner camisole vest

122 2.37

Women's bateau neck
lace patchwork long-
sleeved T-shirt

122 3.6

Women's Black And White
Contrast Sweater
Cardigan

123 15.89

Women's boat neck sexy
lace patchwork long-
sleeved sweater top

123 2.98

Women's bra cup
applique waist strap hot
girl butt-covering dress
short dress

124 14.48
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www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's casual deep V
bell sleeve strappy top

124 3.34

Women's casual hollow
drawstring suspender
woolen vest

125 9.47

Women's casual loose
contrast color hooded
jacket

125 27.55

Women's Casual
Sequined Denim Straight
Pants

126 28.39

Women's Casual
Sleeveless Leopard Print
Pocket Loose Suspender
Jumpsuit

126 16.57

Women's casual solid
color slim fit long sleeve
knitted T-shirt

127 11.74

Women's casual sports
pants with stitching and
webbing sweatpants

127 16.23

Women's casual striped
suspender woolen vest
top

128 8.99

Women's Casual Vintage
Workwear Wide Leg
Loose Straight Jeans

128 19.87

Women's casual zipper
camisole top

129 8.41

women's color block long
sleeve turtleneck sweater
women's fashion

129 18.75

Women's contrast color
casual pullover long
sleeve shirt

130 18.5

Women's Contrasting
Color Lace Sexy Lingerie

130 2.85

Women's Cute Fashion V-
neck Strawberry Mesh
Stitching One-piece

131 4.75

Women's design sequined
backless camisole

131 7.57
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Women's elegant solid
color buttoned waist top

132 15.27

Women's elegant solid
color metal buckle one-
shoulder blouse

132 6.93

Women's ethnic style
printed suspender dress

133 16.14

Women's Fashion Y2k
Street Sleeveless Letter
Printed Vest Top

133 9.39

Women's Floral Print
Sleeveless Waist
Bohemian Dress

134 15.68

Women's Gold Velvet
Casual Swing Collar
blouse

134 18

Women's halter neck tie
printed butterfly tank top

135 2.92

Women's high -necked
sleeveless navel irregular
hem top

135 2.92

Women's holiday casual
sexy V-neck printed lace-
up midi dress

136 18.35

women's hooded pit
knitted sweater cardigan
coat

136 26.2

Women's Hoodie Button-
Down Casual Shirt Jacket

137 7.72

Women's Hot Girl Style
Sexy Irregular Hollow
Hollow Knitted Blouse

137 6.8

Women's irregular lower
back -back lace -up ruffled
upper

138 2.81

Women's Knitted
Drawstring Thread Sexy
Casual All-Match Navel
Vest

139 3

Women's Knitted Half
Cardigan Small Flying
Sleeve Short Vest

139 3.54
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Women's Knitted Sexy
Backless Waffle Halter
Vest

140 3.14

Women's Knitted Sexy
Square Neck Open Back
Cropped Vest

140 3.12

Women's Lace Button
Print Sleeveless Vest
Cropped Top T-Shirt

141 6.47

Women's lace sexy back
suspender vest

141 2.72

Women's Lace-Up Bow V-
Neck Camisole Top

142 3.37

Women's Long Sleeve
Crop Top T-Shirts

142 1.33

Women's loose flared
long-sleeved top

143 16.73

Women's loose hollow
long-sleeved woolen top

143 6.72

women's loose hooded
sweater cardigan sweater

144 24.86

Women's new autumn
and winter plaid woolen
jacket

144 20.52

Women's new autumn
and winter simple long-
sleeved lapel button slit
woolen jacket

145 25.84

Women's new black
suspender midi dress

145 19.91

Women's new bohemian
v-neck ethnic style floral
dress

146 15.31

Women's New Casual
Button Long Sleeve
Woolen Cardigan Top

146 7.16

Women's new casual
fashion resort style printed
tube top dress

147 12.91
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Women's New Casual
Hollow Strap Camisole
Woolen Vest

147 12.5

Women's new casual solid
color slim fit front slit
leggings

148 14.75

Women's new fashionable
round neck big bow long-
sleeved sexy see-through
short top

148 3.46

Women's New
Fashionable Round Neck
Spliced Long Sleeve
Sweater

149 3.8

Women's new lamb wool
short coat zipper
motorcycle style jacket top

149 32.21

Women's New Long
Sleeve Lace Hollow
Cardigan Slim Fit Top for
Hot Girls

150 3.19

Women's new long-
sleeved suit collar double-
breasted woolen coat top

150 25.8

Women's new mini
inverted triangle round
neck elastic slim fit
sleeveless short vest top

151 7.34

Women's new sexy retro
waist slim pleated dress

151 18.41

Women's new simple solid
color pull-sleeve V-neck
button lapel shirt

152 11.89

Women's New Sleeveless
Waist Solid Color Hollow
Splicing Printed Dress

152 20.22

Women's new sling hottie
lace jumpsuit

153 8.13

Women's new street
casual outer wear slim
sports style hot girl
suspenders contrast color
jumpsuit

153 11.04



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's new stretch slim
fit spliced high waist flared
denim trousers

154 24.52

Women's New Versatile
Button Camisole Woolen
Vest

154 9.44

Women's one piece ethnic
print beach skirt

155 15.15

Women's pink chiffon
pullover slimming floral
mid-waist dress

155 13.58

Women's pitted U-neck
long-sleeved solid color
navel-baring French T-
shirt

156 3.24

Women's Plant Element
Print Beach Vacation
Suspender Top Shorts
Two-piece Set

156 13.2

Women's printed
bottoming quick-drying
shorts yoga pants casual
sports waist elastic shorts

157 10.09

Women's Printed Chiffon
Sexy Dresss

157 14.18

Women's ranch style solid
color suspender tied waist
dress

158 19.67

Women's Resort Elegant
U Neck Printed Halter
Long Dress

158 19.54

Women's Retro
Patchwork Women's One-
piece Suit Beachwear
Swimsuit

159 1.96

Women's round neck bow
A-line mid-length dresses

160 20.22

Women's round neckless
sleeve navel short back
top jacket

160 2.83

Women's Seamless
Gradient Slim Body
Quick-drying Sexy Peach
Hip Sports Fitness Pants

161 15.81



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's Seamless High
Waist Gradient Color
Seamless Sports Yoga
Pants

161 13.49

Women's sexy back lace
hollow stitching tube top
top

162 2.69

Women's sexy backless
shoulder strap tube top
top

162 2.59

Women's sexy camisole
solid color V-neck
camisole T-shirt

163 3.28

Women's sexy cross -
hanging neck showed
irregular top

163 2.58

Women's Sexy Elegant
Deep V Long Sleeve
Hollow Beach Dress

164 23.56

Women's sexy low-cut
mid-length camisole dress

164 14.41

Women's sexy off-
shoulder dress

165 17.21

Women's Sexy One-Neck
Hollow Navel knit top

165 2.72

Women's sexy satin silky
sexy tank top

166 2.95

Women's Sexy Sling Solid
Color Sleeveless Tank
Top

166 2.35

Women's sexy solid color
U-neck slit dress

167 15.07

Women's sexy suspender
lace lace-up see-through
vest

167 8.89

Women's sexy suspender
lace lace-up vest

168 11.03

Women's shattered sexy
umbilical camisole top

168 2.88



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's short sexy solid
color slim pleated halter
top

169 6.54

Women's shoulder strap
navel sexy backless vest

169 2.21

Women's sleeveless lotus
leaf edge hem pure color
round neck top

170 2.93

Women's sleeveless navel
simple inner top

170 3.21

Women's Sleeveless Top
Summer Multicolor Casual
Stitching Vest

171 12.21

Women's slim fit hollow
sexy denim vest

171 6.29

Women's Solid Color
Cotton Linen Drawstring
Loose Casual Wide Leg
Trousers

172 12.49

Women's Solid Color
Pleated Design Square
Neck Versatile Simple
Camisole

172 10.27

Women's solid color sexy
trendy midriff-baring short
vest

173 9.55

Women's Solid Color
Sleeveless Hollow Slim
Wool Vest Top

173 3.67

Women's Solid Color
Snap Button Casual
Sleeveless Tank Top

174 3.62

Women's Solid Color
Texture One Shoulder
Tank Top

174 2.74

Women's solid color tight
short tube top

175 9.91

Women's Solid Color V-
neck Long Sleeve Dress

175 15.65



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's Stretch Hip
Lifting Yoga Pants High
Waist Tight Peach Pants
Quick Dry Sweatpants

176 12.74

Women's Striped Halter
Neck Sleeveless Dress

177 14.16

Women's Tie Dye High
Waist Training Sport Yoga
Fitness Pants

177 14.49

Women's Top Swing
Collar Design Sense
Drawstring Sexy Low Cut
Short Vest

178 3.51

Women's twist button
loose knitted cardigan

178 26.16

Women's V-neck loose
long-sleeved T-shirt
button top

179 15.16

Women's Velvet Heart
neck small suspender
vest

179 2.64

Women's Y2g Lace
Hollow Out V-neck
Cardigan Lace-up Long
Sleeve Top

180 1.08

Youth Spring And Autumn
Sportswear Suit

180 13.6

Women's jeans ripped
holes are thinner women's
jeans

138 8

Women's ripped jeans 159 11

Women's Sports Jogging
Loose Sweatpants

176 6.45

Women's jeans 119 14

Slim Jeans Women
Butterfly Sticky Flower
Beaded Split Trousers

103 7



Questions? Call 1-506-300-2487
www.barrybree.com

Name Page Price Quantity

Women's Autumn Solid
Color Rib Knit Bootcut
Trousers

121 3.67



 
BarryBree Catalog

2

Autumn And Winter New
Women's Clothing Sunken
Stripe Stitching Plaid Lace-
up Dress
$5.49 ~ SKU:9883295056164 

Product information:
Pattern: Plaid
Skirt type: A- line skirt
Color: Black
Waist Type: Mid waist
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: temperament commute
Combination form: Single piece
Skirt length: short skirt
Popular elements: Plaid
Fabric name: concave stripes
Sleeve type: regular sleeve
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Sleeve length: long sleeve
Craft: collage/stitching

autumn winter fur fur collar
shawl cardigan wool coat
$24.25 ~ SKU:9648900210980 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 20% Polyester, 80% Acrylic•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Acrylic•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 475 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This autumn and winter fur fur collar shawl cardigan sweater coat
is suitable for many occasions! It makes people look sexy and
elegant, and makes boring life beautiful and interesting. There are
a variety of collocation options that will make you feel confident
and beautiful. It has a comfortable fit that won't restrict your



 
BarryBree Catalog

3

Black Cherry Summary Crop
Top Tee Kawaii Shirt
Women
$1.06 ~ SKU:9640289108260 

Product information:
Fabric name: Cotton
Main fabric composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
The content of the main fabric ingredient: 71%-80%
Main fabric composition 2: polyester fiber (polyester)
The content of main fabric ingredient 2: 71%-80%
Lining composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
Lining ingredient content: 71%-80%
Pattern: Fruit
Style: European and American
Style: Hedging
Sleeve length: short sleeve craft
Edition type: Slim type
Length: Short style (40cmlength≤50cm)
Collar type: round neck
Sleeve type: conventional sleeve
Popular elements: printing, other

Black High Waist Tight
Leather Pants
$11 ~ SKU:9883294531876 

Product information:
Fabric name: Polyester
Color: Black
Size: S,M,L,XL
Applicable Gender: Female
Pants type: tight

 Size:
   Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European
and American people. Choose the larger size if your size between
two sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images.
 Packing list:
 Polyester women's tight leather pants * 1
  Product Image:
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Black Hole Jeans Skinny
Plus Size Pants
$8 ~ SKU:9883299938596 

Fabric classification: cotton elastic denim
1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
 American people. Choose the larger size if your size be
tween two sizes. Please allow 2-
3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

 
2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
 service.

 
3.As you know, the different computers display colors differently,
 the color of the actual item may vary slightly from the following i
mages. Comes with:

Camisole women's v-neck
solid color tube top
sleeveless bottoming top
$3.18 ~ SKU:9640188870948 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 107 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Camisole women's v-neck solid color tube top sleeveless
bottoming top. Please use the size guide shown in our pictures.
Before choosing a size, please read each element of the size guide
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Camouflage hooded crop
hoodie
$0.99 ~ SKU:9640289796388 

Main fabric composition: cotton

 size  bust  length  sleeve shoulder 
 S  104  38  52  52
 M  108  39  53  53
 L  112  40  54  54
 XL  116  41  55  55

UNIT:CM

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 

Casual Cotton Striped
Spaghetti Straps Jumpsuit
$2.25 ~ SKU:9642331504932 

Product information:
Color: gray, black, pink, light blue
Size: S,M,L,XL
Popular elements: elastic waist
Style: Jumpsuit
Fabric name: Cotton
Pants type: Straight
Process: Printing

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images.
 Packing list:
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Casual Fringed Ripped
Loose Denim Jacket
$25.18 ~ SKU:9642525786404 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 542 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Casual Fringed Ripped Loose Denim Jacket. Please use the size
guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please read
each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design, classic
style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure.
The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is normal.

Casual Sleeveless Hollow
Lace Vest
$11.91 ~ SKU:9648900636964 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 158 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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CIAO Letter Graphic Crew
Neck Sweater
$19.37 ~ SKU:9651268911396 

This knitted sweater with high-quality fabric ensures a cozy
and comfortable feel
The bold CIAO letter graphic on the front adds a playful and
eye-catching element
The crew neck design offers a classic and versatile neckline
that suits various styles
The long sleeves provide coverage, making it suitable for
layering during transitional seasons
Wholesale sweaters have delicate cuttings and attractive
prices

•

Size Chart (CM)

Sizes
Bust Hem_

Width
Should

er

Sleeve
_Lengt

h
Length

Relax Relax Relax Relax Relax

Clothing Sleeve Crop Top
Casual Letter Shirt t-Shirts
$1.17 ~ SKU:9640289206564 

Product Information :

Applicable age: 18-24 years old
Fabric: Other
Collar type: Round neck
Pattern: Plain
sleeve length: Short sleeve
Ingredient content: 96% and above

Size Information:
Size: S, M, L

 size bust  waist  hip   length
 S  72-90  68-80  33  39

/wholesale-sweaters-cardigans/
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Contrast Plaid Turtleneck
Sweater Top
$15.84 ~ SKU:9648899686692 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Turtleneck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Lattice•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 285 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Cotton Linen Shirt Plus Size
Ladies Button Loose Long
Sleeve Casual Shirt Women
Tops
$7.43 ~ SKU:9640189034788 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Cotton•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 129 g•
Pocket: No pockets•
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Cropped Sexy Crop Top
Solid Color Camisole Babes
$2.95 ~ SKU:9640187101476 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 69 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Cropped Sexy Crop Top Solid Color Camisole Babes are
suitable for many occasions, and the simple design makes the
boring season colorful and fun. A variety of collocation options
make you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without
restricting your movement. Key features include. - comfortable
fabric

Cross-border New Summer
Short-sleeved T-Shirt
Women's Design Sense,
Short High-Waist Crop Top,
Fashionable Loose
Women's Clothing
$0.62 ~ SKU:9640286486820 

Product Information:

Fabric name: combed cotton
Main fabric composition: cotton
The content of main fabric ingredients: 30%-50%
Main fabric composition 2: polyester fiber (polyester)
The content of main fabric ingredient 2: 51%-70%
Lining composition: spandex
Lining ingredient content: 10% or less
Pattern: Cartoon
style: Casual
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Cute Tortoise Pendant
Copper Plated 18K Gold
Necklace Female Clavicle
Chain Jewelry
$4.6 ~ SKU:9640869200164 

Product Information:
 Material: Environmentally Friendly Brass
Treatment process: electroplating
Modeling: Little Turtle
Extension chain: 10cm or less
Circumference: 21cm (inclusive)-50cm (inclusive)
Color: gold, silver

Packing:
 Clavicle chain* 1

Denim Jumpsuit Loose
Fashion Elastic Mid Waist
Jumpsuit Women's Pants
$24.23 ~ SKU:9648901128484 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Polyester, 20% Rayon•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 473 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Denim Jumpsuit Loose Fashion Elastic Mid Waist Jumpsuit
Women Pants are suitable for many occasions, the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the size guide shown in our images. Please read each element in
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Double-sided brushed nude
high waist, buttocks,
abdomen, yoga clothes,
nine-point pants
$17.39 ~ SKU:9642502750500 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Nylon/Polyamide, 20%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Random print•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 120 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

High waist design supports and flatters curves. Double-sided

Drawstring Knit Paneled
Chiffon Top Feminine Top
European and American
$11.67 ~ SKU:9642525655332 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Square collar•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 141 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Drawstring Knit Paneled Chiffon Top Feminine Top European
and American. Please use the size guide shown in our pictures.
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Elegant Autumn-Winter
Polyester Party Dress with
Dropped Shoulder Sleeves
$17.21 ~ SKU:9642529816868 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% polyester•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 159 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Crafted from 100% polyester, this elegant and sexy party cocktail
dress features a shiny finish that is perfect for special occasions.
The flattering silhouette and intricate patterns make it an ideal

Ethnic style sweet contrast
color striped vest halter
neck sling vest top
$8.16 ~ SKU:9640188707108 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 113 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new ethnic style sweet contrast striped camisole halter neck
camisole top is suitable for many occasions, and the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the size guide shown in our pictures. Please read each element in
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European and American
camouflage yoga pants
women's double-sided nude
printing yoga pants
$17.22 ~ SKU:9642502717732 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Nylon/Polyamide, 20%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 165 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Material: Made with 80% Nylon for durability and 20% Elastane

European and American
sexy tights white sexy bra
$1.93 ~ SKU:9640187003172 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 36 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

European and American sexy tights white sexy bra. Please use the
size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please
read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design,
classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and
leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is
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European And American
Split Bikini Swimsuit
Printing High Waist Sexy
$2.46 ~ SKU:9642317840676 

Product information:
Color: pink, red, black, yellow, green
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style: briefs
Pattern style: high waist, floral fragrance, fresh
Lining name: Polyester
Applicable scenarios: swimming and wading
Sleeve length: sleeveless

 Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images.

European And American
Style Lace Diamond Sexy
Cutout Steel Ring Fishbone
Slim Fit Crop-top Short Top
$1.24 ~ SKU:9640288452900 

Product information:
Color: black, white
Elastic force: medium elastic
Size: XS,S,M,L, chest pad-XS, chest pad-S, chest pad-M, chest
pad-L
Version: slim fit
Style type: Street hipster
Popular elements: Backless
Style: Sling style
Fabric name: lace
Main fabric composition: Nylon
Style: European and American style
Shoulder strap style: Strapless

 Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
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European and American
style new women's French
design embroidery print
dress
$20.61 ~ SKU:9642529751332 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 15% Polyester, 85% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Cute•
Weight: 224 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

European And American
Suit Women's Leopard Print
Short Sleeve Lining Summer
Shorts Two-piece Set
$4.46 ~ SKU:9642323214628 

Product information:
Pattern: Leopard print
Fabric name: Polyester
Color: Leopard print
Sleeve type: bell sleeve
Pants length: Shorts
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: temperament commute
Sleeve length: quarter sleeve
Popular elements: Button
Style: commuting style
Process: Printing

 Size:
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Fashion casual pleated
quick-drying tennis anti-
exposure sports skirt pants
$16.84 ~ SKU:9648900735268 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 22% Elastane/Spandex, 78%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: A•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 175 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Fashion crop top
$1.46 ~ SKU:9640285536548 

Fabric name: stretch polyester
Main fabric composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
The content of the main fabric ingredient: 100%
pattern: plain
Style: sexy
Style: Hedging
Sleeve: Sleeveless
Craft: Collage/Stitching
Collar type: square collar
Sleeve type: conventional sleeve
Popular elements: stitching, navel exposed
1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and America
n people. Choose the larger size if your size between two sizes. Pl
ease allow 2-3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
 service.
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Fashion Plaid Women's Coat
Sweater Stitching
$4.41 ~ SKU:9642332979492 

Product information:
Color: black, green, light blue
Size: S,M,L,XL
Version: Loose
Popular elements: Pocket
Thickness: medium
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Length: medium length (65cm  Applicable Gender: Female
Sleeve length: long sleeve
Craft: collage/stitching

 Size:
Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item

Fashion Super Elastic
Texture Print Tight Casual
High Waist Slim Ninth Pants
$12.96 ~ SKU:9642503242020 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Spandex•
Pattern: Death marble•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 159 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

These trendy ultra-stretch textured printed skinny casual high-
waisted slim-fit cropped pants are perfect for many occasions!
The sexy design paired with a coat will make you look sexy and
elegant, become the best point of attention, and make a boring
life beautiful and interesting. There are a variety of matching
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Fashion Women's Knitted
Vest Sleeveless Pocket
Casual Pullover Vest
$16.53 ~ SKU:9642528637220 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 259 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Fashionable women's knitted sweater vest sleeveless pocket
casual pullover vest suitable for many occasions, the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety
of matching options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the sizing guide shown in our images. Please read each element of

Fashion women's printed
long sleeve dress
$20.59 ~ SKU:9642532176164 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 378 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Fashionable and elegant
animal print sexy backless
suspender dress
$17.1 ~ SKU:9642526114084 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Leopard print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 258 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Fashionable and sexy
sleeveless knitted
embroidered woolen vest
$14.53 ~ SKU:9642340188452 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Fashionable printed casual
resort style cardigan shorts
suit
$16.87 ~ SKU:9648901357860 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 254 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Fashionable sexy suspender
tube top slim fit pleated
shorts suit
$13.21 ~ SKU:9648899817764 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 120 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Fashionable sports yoga
pants with high waist,
tummy control and butt lift,
peach butt fitness pants
$19.5 ~ SKU:9642529063204 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 20% Elastane/Spandex, 80%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 260 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

These yoga pants feature a high-waisted design that perfectly
tightens the tummy and creates a slender waistline. The high-

Fashionable women's new
style lapel zipper sweater
dress
$27.97 ~ SKU:9642531717412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 35% Nylon/Polyamide, 65% Acrylic•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 480 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Female Satin Slim V-Neck
Sexy Camisole Crop Top
$3.16 ~ SKU:9640189100324 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Spaghetti strap•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 49 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sleek satin fabric highlights your curves beautifully. Spaghetti
straps enhance the sexy neckline effect. Perfect for spring-summer
with its cropped design. Solid color offers versatile pairing
options. Ideal for nights out, parties, and social events. Available

Feminine U-neck tie-back
long-sleeved dress
$22.7 ~ SKU:9642530930980 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 516 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Feminine U-neck tie-back long-sleeved dress

Size Chart(inch)
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Flower print hot diamond
shoulder tank top
$3.02 ~ SKU:9640184217892 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 76 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Flower print hot diamond shoulder tank top. Please use the size
guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please read
each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design, classic
style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure.
The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is normal.

Geometric print fashionable
new suspender wide-leg
casual elastic pants suit
$19.5 ~ SKU:9648901325092 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 346 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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German traditional clothing
Bavaria Oktoberfest Ding
Dong costume white shirt
$2.64 ~ SKU:9640188379428 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Daily•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

Halloween Elastic Slim Fit
Sports Tight Leggings
$10.81 ~ SKU:9642504356132 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 153 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Elastic slim fit sports leggings. Please use the size guide shown in
our pictures. Before choosing a size, please read each element of
the size guide carefully. Unique design, classic style, casual and
comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure. The size is
measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is normal.
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High Waist Belly
Contracting Yoga Pants
Women's Sports Tight
$6 ~ SKU:9883294892324 

Product information:
Fabric name: brocade ammonia polished fabric
Applicable scenarios: running sports, fitness and bodybuilding,
sports trends, cycling sports, ice and snow sports, extreme
challenges, Dance Sports
Color: black, light gray, dark gray, khaki, dark coffee, navy blue
Size: XS,S,M,L
Series: sanding
Image: Bell-bottom pants
Fabric composition: Nylon
Lining name: Chemical Fiber blend

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you

High Waist Pants Hip Lift
Yoga Fitness Pants Elastic
Waist Slim Ninth Pants
$17.52 ~ SKU:9642502586660 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Nylon/Polyamide, 20%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 186 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Material: Crafted from a blend of 80% Nylon and 20% Elastane,
these pants offer a perfect balance of flexibility and support for
workout comfort. Design: Featuring a high waist design and hip
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Hip lift fitness pants High
waist tight yoga pants
$16.2 ~ SKU:9642503045412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Nylon/Polyamide, 20%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 192 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Designed for both fitness enthusiasts and casual wear, these high-
waist tight yoga pants highlight your natural curves and offer
maximum comfort. With a sleek, solid color and a knit
construction, they are perfect for all seasons. Ideal for social
media fitness influencers and trending on major e-commerce

Hollow backless tight short-
sleeved navel half-high
collar solid color hot girl
sexy T-shirt
$9 ~ SKU:9648899490084 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Turtleneck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 63 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Hollow backless tight short-sleeved navel half-high collar solid
color hot girl sexy T-shirt is suitable for many occasions. The
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Inner bottoming vest fixed
chest pad high breathable
vest
$2.26 ~ SKU:9640188346660 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 87 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Inner bottoming vest fixed chest pad high breathable vest. Please
use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,

Knit Sweater Woman With
Thick Thread, Long Sleeves
And High Neck Pullover
$23.74 ~ SKU:9648900866340 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Acrylic•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 483 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Stay cozy and chic this autumn-winter season with our Knit
Sweater for women. Featuring a thick thread acrylic material, this
solid color pullover offers a high neck design and long sleeves for
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Lace long-sleeve new top V-
neck sexy women's clothing
$11.81 ~ SKU:9642527654180 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Deep V•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 135 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Lace Long Sleeve New Top V Neck Sexy Women's
Dress is suitable for many occasions, and the simple design makes
the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits
snugly without restricting your movement. Key features include. -
comfortable fabric casual daily wear

Ladies Bright Diamond
Tassel Wrap Chest Tank Top
$8.64 ~ SKU:9642336780580 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 90% Polyester, 10% Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 129 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sparkle under the city lights with our Ladies Bright Diamond
Tassel Wrap Chest Tank Top. This sexy, sling-style top features
dazzling rhinestones and slight fabric elasticity, promising a
comfortable yet striking fit. Perfect for parties and social media
spotlights.
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Ladies Elegant Classic Beer
Festival Regular Bottoming
Lace Stitching Sexy
Underwear Shirt
$2.64 ~ SKU:9640188608804 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Daily•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Ladies Elegant Classic
Halloween Beer Festival
Regular Lace Bottoming
Shirt
$2.72 ~ SKU:9640188576036 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Daily•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Ladies' Loose Strap Fashion
Sexy Slim Tank Top
$6.85 ~ SKU:9640188936484 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 82% Viscose ,18% Elastane•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Spaghetti strap•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woolen•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 117 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Elegant asymmetric design, hugs curves nicely. High elasticity,
gives a perfect fit and comfort. Crafted from soft viscose fiber,
ideal for summer. Pair with shorts or skirts for a chic look.
Perfect for casual outings and beach days. Available for wholesale

Ladies new holiday casual
crochet flower suspender
dress
$18.14 ~ SKU:9648899719460 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 220 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Ladies new solid color
corduroy overalls
$24.37 ~ SKU:9648901783844 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 560 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Siz
e

US UK
Len
gth

Hi
p

Wa
ist

Bus
t

Ladies new solid color
sleeveless stitching dress
$12.17 ~ SKU:9648899981604 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 133 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Ladies Stitching Hip Lifting
High Waist Sweatpants
Yoga Pants
$10.6 ~ SKU:9642503176484 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 200 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's paneled butt lift high waist sweatpants yoga pants are
suitable for many occasions, the simple design makes the boring
season colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation options
make you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without
restricting your movement. Key features include. - comfortable

Linen Turn-down Collar
Sweet Enough Striped
Button Up Top
$19.23 ~ SKU:9648902766884 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Rainbow stripes•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 248 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Colorful stripes bring vibrant flair to any look. Soft woven
polyester for comfort year-round. Long sleeve with classic turn-
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Long Sleeve V Neck
Pullover Women's Sweater
Top
$3.63 ~ SKU:9640184611108 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 219 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Long Sleeve V Neck Pullover Women's Sweater Top. Please use
the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique

Loose-fitting low-rise casual
pants, hot girl drape knitted
wide-leg trousers
$13.75 ~ SKU:9642528211236 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 300 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Low-cut backless metallic
suspender dress
$14.63 ~ SKU:9648900407588 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 140 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Men's Polo Collar Solid
Color Long-sleeved Sports
$6.3 ~ SKU:9640870445348 

Product information:
Color: black, gray, white, khaki, sapphire blue
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL,XXXL
Version: Loose
Main fabric composition: Polyester Fiber (polyester)
Sleeve length: long sleeve

 Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images.
 Packing list:
 Top*1
  Product Image:
                      Comes with:
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New all-match thin denim
short-sleeved shirt casual
top
$19.7 ~ SKU:9642523230500 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Rayon•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 379 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

The new all-match thin denim short-sleeved shirt casual top is
suitable for many occasions. The simple design makes the boring

New American Denim
Overalls Casual Pocket
Shorts Elastic Waist
$21.4 ~ SKU:9642522804516 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Retro•
Weight: 434 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

The new American style denim overalls casual pocket shorts with
elastic waist are suitable for many occasions, and the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety
of collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits
snugly without restricting your movement. Key features include. -
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New arrival printed ruffled
wide-leg trousers with slits
$15.54 ~ SKU:9648901849380 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 260 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New beach dress solid color
sexy knitted hollow bikini
swimsuit cover up sun
protection clothing
$16.32 ~ SKU:9648900669732 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Polyester, 20% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 294 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New button round neck
ribbed simple casual ladies
t-shirt top
$15.68 ~ SKU:9642524901668 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 290 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New camisole hollow solid
color vacation vest
$9.41 ~ SKU:9642340155684 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Acrylic•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 160 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust
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New camisole wide shoulder
strap sexy slim hot girl
sleeveless top
$8.42 ~ SKU:9642340090148 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 85 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

New casual solid color one
shoulder waist top
$3.52 ~ SKU:9640185266468 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 97% Polyester, 3% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 160 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

This top has a one-shoulder three-dimensional flower design,
exposing the shoulder lines and showing off the graceful curves of
women. The waist design can effectively modify the body shape
and make the waist slimmer, while also increasing the three-
dimensional sense of the overall shape. The design style of the top
focuses on casualness, comfort and ease. Suitable for daily
activities, casual gatherings or weekend leisure time, showing a
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New casual suspender slim
fit patchwork navel-baring
solid color tank top T-shirt
$7.05 ~ SKU:9642339270948 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 108 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new casual suspender slim-fitting patchwork midriff-baring
solid color tank top T-shirt is suitable for summer leisure, dates
or parties. You can pair it with bottoms such as shorts, wide-leg
pants or a skirt, choosing the right combination according to the
occasion and personal style. In terms of shoes and accessories,

New Casual Wrap
Sleeveless Printed Shirt
$12 ~ SKU:9642526671140 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 94 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK
Leng
th

Bust
Shou
lder
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New coat button plaid
printed small suit women's
mid-length coat
$21.45 ~ SKU:9648902177060 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Cotton•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Plaid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 454 g•
Pocket: Flap pocket•

New coat button plaid printed small suit women's mid-length
coat with multiple matching options to make you confident and
beautiful. Please use the sizing guide shown in our images. Please
read each element of the sizing guide carefully before choosing a
size. The size is measured manually, and there is an error of 1-

New comfortable casual
vest open vest
$18.96 ~ SKU:9642526638372 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 137 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK
Leng
th

Bust
Shou
lder



 
BarryBree Catalog

41

New Commuting Solid Color
V-Neck Waist Puff Sleeve
Swing Dress
$16.33 ~ SKU:9648899916068 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 261 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New contrast color stitching
sweatshirt texture casual
comfortable V-neck stand
collar sweatshirt
$18.13 ~ SKU:9642525688100 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Standing neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 380 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New drawstring yoga wear
breathable solid color
running tights
$19.59 ~ SKU:9642528997668 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 22% Elastane/Spandex, 78%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New elastic high waist
seamless gradient pants
sports slimming tight yoga
pants
$13.43 ~ SKU:9642503766308 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 213 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

The new elastic high waist seamless gradient pants sports
slimming leggings cropped pants yoga pants are suitable for many
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New elegant solid color tube
top dress
$21.92 ~ SKU:9642525557028 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Cotton, 5% Linen•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 369 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

The new elegant solid color tube top dress is suitable for many
occasions, and the simple design makes the boring season colorful
and interesting. A variety of collocation options make you
confident and beautiful. Please use the size guide shown in our
pictures. Please read each element in the size guide carefully
before choosing a size. The size is measured manually, and it is
normal for there to be an error of 1-3cm. Key features include. -

New Fashion Printed Square
Collar Waist-tight Mid-sleeve
Dress
$1.78 ~ SKU:9640287502628 

Product information:
Pattern: geometric pattern
Fabric name: Polyester
Skirt type: hip skirt
Color: Brown
Sleeve type: regular sleeve
Main fabric composition: PVC
Size: XXL,S,XL,M,L,XXXL
Style type: temperament commute
Skirt length: mid-length skirt
Sleeve length: half sleeve
Skirt Category: Dress
Popular elements: 3D/stereo pattern
Style: pullover
Style: Elegant style
Process: Printing
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New Fashion Sexy
Embroidered Suspender
Dress
$19.64 ~ SKU:9642526245156 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 292 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New Fashion Sexy Sequined
Strap Square Neck Backless
Dress Dress
$30.82 ~ SKU:9642525163812 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 426 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New fashionable and sexy sequin strappy square neck backless
bodycon dress. This dress is the epitome of glamor and style,
perfect for special occasions and formal events. The dress features
a stunning square neckline that adds a touch of sophistication and
glamor to your look. Lace-up details create a chic and eye-
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New fashionable and sexy
solid color knitted vest
backless strappy top
$11.63 ~ SKU:9642339533092 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 76 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

New fashionable button
placket lace back strap vest
top
$12.35 ~ SKU:9642339828004 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% Cotton•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New fashionable button placket lace back strap vest top, match
with different bottoms and accessories to create a variety of
styles. The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. Please use the sizing guide shown in our images and
please read each element of the sizing guide carefully before
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New Fashionable Puff
Sleeve Striped T-Shirt
$11.05 ~ SKU:9642526933284 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 142 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New fashionable ruffled
floral camisole vest
$7.65 ~ SKU:9642337370404 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Cotton•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Small flower•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 52 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new fashionable ruffled floral camisole, the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
matching options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the sizing guide shown in our images. Please read each element of
the sizing guide carefully before choosing a size. The size is
measured manually, and there is an error of 1-3cm, which is
normal. Key features include. - Comfortable fabric Can be worn
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New Fashionable Slit Party
Loose Holiday Dress
$16.99 ~ SKU:9648900571428 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 174 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

NEW HALTER BRALET
CROP TOP
$0.76 ~ SKU:9640286093604 

 Comes with:
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New hollow lace 2-piece
dress
$23.64 ~ SKU:9648899752228 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 360 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New lace satin sweet slim
buttoned small camisole
$17.87 ~ SKU:9642339434788 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Polyester, 20% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new lace satin sweet slim-fit buttoned camisole can be
matched with different bottoms to create a variety of styles. The
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting.
Please use the sizing guide shown in our images and please read
each element of the sizing guide carefully before selecting a size.
The size is measured manually, and there is an error of 1-3cm,
which is normal.



 
BarryBree Catalog

49

New lace stitching sling
jumpsuit sexy slim halter
bodysuit
$12.98 ~ SKU:9648901914916 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 170 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New lace stitching solid
color T-shirt dress
$16.3 ~ SKU:9642532340004 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 350 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New lantern sleeve V-neck
top, vacation style sexy
navel-baring strappy shorts
set
$18.02 ~ SKU:9642528244004 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 197 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new lantern sleeve V-neck top, resort-style sexy navel-baring
strappy shorts suit is suitable for a variety of scenes, and the
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A

New love hollow navel-
baring sweater holiday top
$3.58 ~ SKU:9640184840484 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Viscose•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 200 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust
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New motorcycle style short
lapel jacket
$40.26 ~ SKU:9648900604196 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 692 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New multi-color yoga sports
tight trousers
$15.62 ~ SKU:9642504323364 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 233 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new multi-color yoga sports leggings can be paired with yoga
tops, sports bras or sports T-shirts. You can choose the suitable
style and color according to your personal preferences and sports
needs.

Size Chart(inch)
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New Navel Sports Trend
Pajamas Tie-dyed Home
Wear Suit
$2.65 ~ SKU:9642332160292 

Product information:
Fabric name: cotton blend
Applicable scenarios: Outdoor, family
Color: colorful tie-dye
Main fabric composition: Cotton
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Function: Leisure, sleep, home, comfortable, can be worn
outdoors
Fabric thickness (gram weight): moderate (181-200g/square
meter)
Style: shirt and pants
Style: ins style, IP peripheral

 Size:

Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and

New one-shoulder striped
short-sleeved dress
$18.34 ~ SKU:9642524606756 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: One-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 396 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New peach yoga high waist
hip lifting leggings and
flared pants
$16.81 ~ SKU:9642504061220 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 25% Elastane/Spandex, 75%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: A•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

These yoga sweatpants feature a high-rise waist that controls your
tummy and enhances your natural curves for a flattering
silhouette. Butt lift feature provides extra support and a lifted
look, accentuating your flattering buttocks. Made of high-quality

New retro square neck
pleated slim high waisted
short vest halter top
$11.96 ~ SKU:9642339631396 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 70 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust
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New ripped jeans
$6.8 ~ SKU:9883301151012 

Main fabric ingredient: cashmere
Main fabric composition: 30%-50%
Content of lining: 81-90%
Style: pencil pants/peduncle pants
Pant length: long pants
Thickness: normal

 Size  Waist/cm Hip/cm  Length/cm 
 S  68  88  99
 M  72  92  100
 L  76  96  101
 XL  80  100  102
 XXL  84  104  103
 3XL  88  108  104

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and America
n people. Choose the larger size if your size between two sizes. Pl

New seamless solid color
knitted high elastic yoga
pants running sports fitness
pants
$12.94 ~ SKU:9642528964900 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New sequined solid color
casual vest
$8.69 ~ SKU:9642339959076 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 120 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK
Leng
th

Bust
Shou
lder

New sexy all-match halter
neck sequin vest party
nightclub babes women's
clothing
$6.26 ~ SKU:9640186937636 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 99 g•
Pocket: No pockets•
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New sexy holiday print tube
top shawl two-piece set
$16.25 ~ SKU:9648900964644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 144 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK Bust
Leng
th

Wais
t

New sexy slim fit sleeveless
lace tank top T-shirt
$7.2 ~ SKU:9642338943268 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Polyester, 20% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 63 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new sexy slim sleeveless lace tank top T-shirt, the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. When
purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the appropriate
size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each element in the
size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured
manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal. In addition, it is
important to understand the material and care requirements of
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New Sexy Small V-neck
Hollow Lace Jumpsuit
$3.83 ~ SKU:9642330718500 

Product information:
Color: black, black and white
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Style type: street fashion
Style: Jumpsuit
Fabric name: lace
Main fabric composition: nylon
Pants type: Straight
Style: European and American style
Craft: Jacquard

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item

New Simple Cable V-neck
Solid Color Sweater Vest
$16.45 ~ SKU:9642532503844 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 260 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)



 
BarryBree Catalog

58

New Simple Hooded Cable
Solid Color Cardigan
Sweater
$19.75 ~ SKU:9648902275364 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Hooded•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 341 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New Simple Round Neck
Long Sleeve Hollow Sweater
$18.09 ~ SKU:9642524737828 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 360 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New simple solid color long-
sleeved T-shirt color
matching contrast casual
home tops
$14.24 ~ SKU:9642524967204 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New simple thin short
casual wool cardigan
$17.65 ~ SKU:9648902537508 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Deep V•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 294 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New Simple Zipper Half-
open Striped Lapel Vest
$18.3 ~ SKU:9642524705060 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 320 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New single-breasted square
collar sleeveless tops slim
fit hip sexy women's fashion
two-piece suit
$22.53 ~ SKU:9648899391780 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 398 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New sleeveless hot girl
street shooting sexy tube
top top
$9.58 ~ SKU:9642340122916 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 89 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New solid color hollow
navel-exposing lace hip
dress
$14.24 ~ SKU:9648899293476 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New solid color lace-up
elastic waist trousers simple
temperament commuter
tapered trousers
$16.98 ~ SKU:9648902045988 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 320 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New solid color mid-collar
women's tops
$12.06 ~ SKU:9642530046244 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 131 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New solid color mid-collar women's tops, simple design makes
the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of matching
options make you confident and beautiful. Please use the sizing
guide shown in our images when purchasing. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
are measured manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal.
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New solid color pullover V-
neck dress
$18.33 ~ SKU:9642530308388 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 395 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new solid color pullover V-neck dress cardigan jacket suit is
suitable for many occasions, and the simple design makes the
boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation
options make you confident and beautiful. Please use the size
guide shown in our images. Please read each element in the size
guide carefully before choosing a size. The size is measured
manually, and it is normal for there to be an error of 1-3cm. Key

New solid color resort
fashion jumpsuit
$19.45 ~ SKU:9642531815716 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 390 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New solid color round neck
slim fit inner midriff-baring
long-sleeved short T-shirt
$2.65 ~ SKU:9640188248356 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 88 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The neckline of the T-shirt is a round neck design, simple and
classic. The round neck design is suitable for various face shapes
and necklines, and can show women's elegance and beauty. The
design exposes the navel at the waist, adding some sexy and
fashionable elements. The navel-baring design can show off a

New split skirt style sexy
high waist suspender bikini
hot spring resort style bikini
$17.06 ~ SKU:9648900800804 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 82% Polyester, 18% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Cute•
Weight: 203 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The split-skirt sexy high-waist suspender bikini spa resort style
bikini is suitable for wearing on vacations, beaches, resorts,
swimming pools and other occasions. It can show women's ease,
freedom and fashion style.



 
BarryBree Catalog

65

New spring and summer
fashionable commuter suit
sleeveless vest and shorts
suit
$24.87 ~ SKU:9648900997412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 331 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New straight leg loose
sweatpants wide leg pants
outdoor dance casual
trousers
$17.32 ~ SKU:9642523558180 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 425 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

These trousers have a straight and loose design, and the overall
legs are loose and comfortable, giving you plenty of room for
movement. The straight, loose cut also creates a casual, effortless
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New style brushed striped
knitted skirt long sleeve
pleated patchwork dress
$14.97 ~ SKU:9642532307236 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 290 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New style denim lace work
dress casual mid length
skirt trendy
$25.14 ~ SKU:9642527949092 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Retro•
Weight: 521 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

The new denim strappy dress casual mid-length skirt is suitable
for many occasions, and the simple design makes the boring
season colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation options
make you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without
restricting your movement. Key features include. - comfortable
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New style floral print
suspender dress
$17.95 ~ SKU:9648901488932 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 318 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Siz
e

US UK
Len
gth

Bus
t

Hi
p

Wa
ist

New style knitted tube top
camisole with decorative
buttoned blouse inside
$6.06 ~ SKU:9642339008804 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 83 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The tube top design of the top gives it a sexy feel, while the
external decorative buttons add a touch of fashion element. The
details of the buttons make the overall look more refined,
showing your taste and fashion awareness. This knitted bandeau
camisole can be worn underneath or on its own, making it
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New style lace embroidered
fishbone sexy tube top
suspender hollow backless
outer bra
$12.59 ~ SKU:9642338222372 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 7% Elastane/Spandex, 93%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 79 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new lace embroidered fishbone sexy tube top suspender
hollow backless outer bra is suitable for a variety of scenes. The

New style lace slope neck
cardigan loose splicing
backless lace-up solid color
top
$12.03 ~ SKU:9642339238180 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 105 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

This new lace slope neck cardigan loose patchwork backless lace-
up solid color top is suitable for various occasions, such as
parties, dates, nightclubs, etc. You can pair it with high-waisted
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New style lace splicing
short-sleeved T-shirt V-neck
casual and comfortable top
$12.8 ~ SKU:9648901816612 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 190 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New style off-shoulder short
contrast color contrast color
print wide-leg pants two-
piece set
$19.98 ~ SKU:9642532405540 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 321 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New Style Ring European
Retro Zircon Inlaid Diamond
Ring
$3.46 ~ SKU:9640869003556 

Product information:
Type: Ring

Material: gold-plated

Modeling: Geometry
Treatment process: electroplating
Style: Women's
Inlay material: alloy inlaid artificial gems/semi-precious stones
Color: GJZ304, GJZ305
Popular elements: metal, pearl, pattern, pastoral, ethnic, retro,
geometric, national tide
Size information:
No. 6, No. 7, No. 8, No. 9, No. 10, No. 11, No. 12, No. 13
Package:
Alloy ring x1

New style simple casual
versatile vest with bow
decorative top
$9.23 ~ SKU:9642339762468 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 90% Polyester, 10% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 77 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New style temperament tube
top gradient dress
$16.32 ~ SKU:9642523885860 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 94% Polyester, 6% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Off-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 314 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New stylish and sexy bubble
wave high waist slim dress
$16.2 ~ SKU:9648901226788 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 251 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New suspender print dress
INS loose holiday casual
elastic dress
$18.22 ~ SKU:9642529521956 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 308 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New three-dimensional
embroidery sleeveless stand
collar lace stitching dress
$15.91 ~ SKU:9642525425956 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Standing neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 240 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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New Tie-dye Printed High
Elastic Tight Sports Pants
$2.25 ~ SKU:9642328391972 

Product information:
Color: black, gray, orange
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL,XXXL
Applicable scenarios: running sports, fitness equipment, health
massage, fitness and bodybuilding, sports trends, cycling sports,
field entertainment equipment, table tennis, other ball games
Inventory Type: whole transaction
Function: Ultra Light
Fabric composition: Polyester Fiber
Style: casual, elastic
Clothing style: slim fit

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different

New Tie-dye Printed Lace-up
Tube Top Shorts Suit
$1.75 ~ SKU:9640286159140 

Product information:
Pattern: Printing
Color: yellow, purple, green, colorful
Pants length: Shorts
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: street fashion
Popular elements: Printing
Fabric name: knitted
Sleeve type: sleeveless
Main fabric composition: Cotton
Applicable Gender: Female
Sleeve length: sleeveless
Style: European and American style

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
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New Tie-dyed Printed
Hooded Cropped Sweater
For Women
$1.12 ~ SKU:9640286978340 

Product information:
Pattern: Printing
Color: blue
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Version: Loose
Style type: street fashion
Combination form: Single piece
Popular elements: Printing
Style: pullover
Thickness: medium
Fabric name: knitted
Sleeve type: regular sleeve
Main fabric composition: Cotton
Length: Short (40cm  Applicable Gender: Female
Sleeve length: long sleeve
Style: hip hop style
Process: Printing/printing and dyeing

New Tight-fitting Cotton
Crop Top Summer
$1.29 ~ SKU:9640286355748 

Product information:

Made of: Cotton
Pattern: plain
Style: Commuter
Commuter: Korean
Collar type: V-neck
Popular elements: shirring
Main color: white black
Sleeve type: conventional

Size Information:
Size: S/M/L/XL/XXL

Note:
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New V-neck Sexy Hollow
Strappy Backless
Suspender Top
$10.32 ~ SKU:9642339205412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 66 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new V-neck sexy hollow strapless halter top has a simple
design that makes the boring season colorful and interesting.
When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the
appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes

New women's casual printed
tube top dress
$15.96 ~ SKU:9642528309540 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 170 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK Bust
Leng
th
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New Women's Clothing New
Fashion Contrast Color
Striped Vest
$11.47 ~ SKU:9642338582820 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 160 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's fashionable contrast striped vest, simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. When
purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the appropriate
size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each element in the
size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured

New women's fashion
knitted striped sleeveless
vest/trousers
$13.32 ~ SKU:9642527719716 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 110 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New women's fashionable
and versatile slim fit satin
camisole
$13.31 ~ SKU:9642339172644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Leopard print•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 90 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's fashionable and versatile slim fit satin camisole,
suitable for daily wear, dating, shopping, etc. Paired with the
right bottoms and shoes, you can create different styles, from
casual to trendy.

New women's fashionable
casual all-match lace-up
loose striped top
$15.12 ~ SKU:9648902340900 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 90% Polyester, 10% Cotton•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 222 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New women's fashionable
halterneck sexy low-cut
backless knitted hollow see-
through dress
$17.28 ~ SKU:9648901062948 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 277 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New women's fashionable
slim solid color mesh hollow
see-through lace long-
sleeved cardigan
$6.2 ~ SKU:9640184283428 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 178 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Wear a solid-color mesh hollow see-through lace long-sleeved
cardigan for a fashionable slim fit and slimming temperament.
The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
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New women's floral hollow
pleated sleeveless high
waist dress
$23.4 ~ SKU:9642523427108 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 420 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New women's fluffy pleated
hem sexy backless V-neck
sleeveless suspender dress
$15.27 ~ SKU:9642529095972 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: Deep V•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 144 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New women's hand-sewn
bow contrasting color
breathable sports
underwear with breast pads
$8.97 ~ SKU:9640188903716 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 20% Elastane/Spandex, 80%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Cute•
Weight: 180 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's hand-sewn bow-knot contrasting breathable sports
bra with padded bra. The simple design makes the boring season

New Women's High Waist
Hip Pocket Yoga Pants
$13.53 ~ SKU:9642504192292 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 257 g•
Pocket: Straight pocket•

These high-waisted hip pocket yoga pants are designed for yoga
and fitness activities. It has a high-waisted design that provides
good abdominal support and flattering effect, showing off your
curves. The butt lift design highlights the lines of your buttocks,
making them look fuller and perkier. In addition, these yoga pants
are equipped with pockets for you to store small items, adding to
the practicality. You can pair it with a suitable sports top or T-
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New women's hottie
houndstooth bow strap
temperament slim vest
$9.81 ~ SKU:9642339500324 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Lattice•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 75 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

New women's lace mesh
splicing suspenders see-
through backless sexy short
top
$7.62 ~ SKU:9642338124068 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 79 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's lace mesh splicing suspenders see-through backless
sexy short top, the simple design makes the boring season
colorful and interesting. Paired with the right bottoms and
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New women's lace mesh
suspender long dress
$29.26 ~ SKU:9642523033892 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 480 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

New women's lapel plush
short jacket
$25.75 ~ SKU:9642526048548 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 466 g•
Pocket: Straight pocket•

New women's lapel plush short jacket, simple design makes the
boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of matching
options make you confident and beautiful. Please use the sizing
guide shown in our images when purchasing. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
are measured manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal.
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New women's loose solid
color fashionable lapel coat
$37.68 ~ SKU:9648902242596 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 838 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's loose solid color fashionable lapel coat makes you
confident and beautiful. Please use the sizing guide shown in our
images when purchasing. Please read each element in the size
guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured
manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal.

Size Chart(inch)

New women's niche design
outer wear long-sleeved
tops
$3.39 ~ SKU:9640184512804 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 138 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's niche design long-sleeved outerwear tops. The
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A
variety of matching options make you confident and beautiful.
Please use the sizing guide shown in our images. Please read each
element of the sizing guide carefully before choosing a size. The
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New women's off-shoulder
lace bow long-sleeved T-
shirt
$12.37 ~ SKU:9648901456164 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 30% Elastane/Spandex, 70% Cotton•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 121 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new women's off-shoulder lace bow long-sleeved T-shirt, the
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A
variety of matching options make you confident and beautiful.
Please use the sizing guide shown in our images when purchasing.
Please read each element in the size guide carefully before

New women's puff sleeve
sexy floral navel cropped
top
$6.18 ~ SKU:9640188444964 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Floral•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 84 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The puff sleeve design of the top brings you a romantic and cute
atmosphere. The floral pattern adds a sense of lightness and
nature, giving it a fresh feel. The short design shows off your
waistline and makes you exude sexy and fashionable. The design
of gathered steel rings gives moderate support to the chest,
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New women's simple sexy
slim knitted skirt
$16.06 ~ SKU:9642524836132 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 110 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Waist

New women's solid color
lapel tie pocket cardigan
three buttons mid-length
sweater coat
$30.08 ~ SKU:9648901620004 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Acrylic•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 668 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new women's solid-color lapel tie pocket cardigan three-
button mid-length sweater jacket is suitable for many occasions.
The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
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New women's solid color
short halter top
$3.16 ~ SKU:9640188805412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 61 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

New women's solid color short halter tops, paired with dresses of
the same color to create a variety of styles. The simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. Please use the
sizing guide shown in our images and please read each element of
the sizing guide carefully before selecting a size. The size is
measured manually, and there is an error of 1-3cm, which is
normal.

New Women's Solid Color
Short Sleeve
$1.91 ~ SKU:9642316693796 

Product information:
Pattern: Printing
Fabric name: pure cotton
Color: Black
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL,3XL,4XL,5XL
Sleeve length: short sleeve
Style: pullover

 Size:
Unit: cm

  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images.
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New women's solid color
single-breasted loose
dropped shoulder sleeve
knitted cardigan
$23.68 ~ SKU:9648900538660 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 316 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's solid color single-breasted loose knitted cardigan with
dropped shoulder sleeves. The simple design makes the boring
season colorful and interesting. A variety of matching options

New Women's V-neck
Holiday Coconut Tree Print
Sleeveless Vest Top
Trousers Set
$19.73 ~ SKU:9642523001124 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Cotton•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 280 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New Women's V-neck Long
Sleeve Jumpsuit High Waist
Lace-up Jumpsuit
$26.1 ~ SKU:9648901947684 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 610 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

New women's V-neck
patchwork lace top
$13.52 ~ SKU:9648899522852 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Viscose•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 165 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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New yoga tight-fitting
shoulder sleeve sports
jumpsuit shorts
$15.5 ~ SKU:9642526441764 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 25% Elastane/Spandex, 75%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 183 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

These one-piece shorts feature a form-fitting design that allows
you to move easily during yoga or fitness classes. Shorts provide
coverage and support while showing off your legs and
accentuating your curves.

Nude Feel Seamless Slightly
Flared Yoga Pants Sports
Running Fitness Pants
Female High Waist Hip Lift
Yoga Pants
$2.8 ~ SKU:9883295220004 

Product information:
Thickness: medium
Pattern: solid color
Fabric name: Polyester
Color: dark brown, gray, black, royal blue, dark blue
Elasticity: high elasticity
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Pants length: cropped pants
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Pants type: loose type
Popular elements: Folding
Style: bootcut trousers

 Size:
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Off-shoulder long-sleeved
gathered midriff-baring knit
top
$3.3 ~ SKU:9640184774948 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 161 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Off-shoulder long-sleeved gathered midriff-baring knit top

Size Chart(inch)

One-shoulder ruffled
trumpet sleeve ribbon dress
$16.77 ~ SKU:9648899555620 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 98% Polyester, 2% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 320 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Pentagram Geometry Paste
Cloth Embroidery Hooded
Cardigan Sweater Men
$9.53 ~ SKU:9640869888292 

Product information:
Pattern: five-pointed star
Pocket Style: pocket with embedded lines
Color: light gray, black
No padding: no padding
Suitable for people: Youth
Size: M,L,XL
Version: Loose
Style: Cardigan
Thickness: ordinary
Fabric name: cotton blend

 Size:
   Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European
and American people. Choose the larger size if your size between
two sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you

Personalized wine glass
print Baby Tee navel-baring
short-sleeved versatile T-
shirt
$2.45 ~ SKU:9640188641572 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Daily•
Weight: 95 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Plus Size Solid Color
Women's Short Fur Coat
$6.66 ~ SKU:9642326950180 

Product information:
Fabric name: artificial fur
Color: white, khaki, black, light gray, dark gray, apricot, leather
pink, light purple
Sleeve type: regular sleeve
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL,XXXL
 Style type: Street hipster
Applicable age group: Adult
Sleeve length: long sleeve
With fur collar or not: no fur collar
Style: European and American style

 Size:

Plush Homewear Casual 3-
piece Pajamas Long Sleeve
Navel Vest Shorts Set
$21.56 ~ SKU:9648900178212 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Cotton•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 556 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Plush loungewear casual 3-piece pajamas long-sleeve cropped vest
shorts set is suitable for casual occasions! The simple design
makes the boring season colorful and fun. A variety of collocation
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Polka dot print slip dress
$19.75 ~ SKU:9648899227940 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Daily•
Weight: 230 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Size US UK
Leng
th

Bust
Wais

t

S 4 8 31 28 27

Printed Halter Neck High
Waist Scheming Red
Temperament Commuter
Dress
$17.37 ~ SKU:9642527588644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 246 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Printed Halter Neck High Waist Scheming Red Temperament
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Printed Pullover Slim Fit
Crew Neck Short T-Shirt
Crop Navel T-Shirt
$2.25 ~ SKU:9640289632548 

Product information:

Fabric name: polyester fiber
Main fabric composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
Pattern: Print
Style: leisure
Style: Hedging
sleeve length: short sleeve
Process: printing/dyeing

Size Information:
Size: S/M/L/XL/XXL/3XL

Pure color sexy sequin slit
long skirt shirred one-
shoulder evening dress
$14.97 ~ SKU:9642526572836 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 189 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

New solid color sexy sequin slit maxi skirt shirred one shoulder
evening dress is suitable for many occasions, the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
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Rainbow crop top
$1.49 ~ SKU:9640285667620 

Material: polyester

                         Size                    Bust          Clothes length

Size:cm

 
1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and America
n people. Choose the larger size if your size between two sizes. Pl
ease allow 2-3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

Retro workwear style zipper
belt decorated short PU
leather skirt
$23.37 ~ SKU:9648899621156 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 377 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Romantic Cotton Sleeveless
Round Neck Solid Vacation
Dress
$15.57 ~ SKU:9642528866596 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Cotton•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 245 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Fashion Ladies Dress is perfect for Spring-Summer.
Featuring a sleeveless design and round neck, its knit construction

Seamless jacquard crop top
$1.54 ~ SKU:9640285208868 

Product category: T-shirt
Applicable gender: female
pattern: plain
Suitable season: spring, autumn, summer
Fabric name: Spandex/Lycra
Fabric composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
Fabric composition content: 60 (%)

 Size Bust  Length 
 S  29x2  40
 M  31x2  42
 L  33x2  43

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement.

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
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Sequin Alphabet Print
Casual Skinny Short Sleeve
Simple Hong Kong Style
Crop Top
$0.97 ~ SKU:9640289009956 

Product information:
Material: Polyester Fiber (Polyester)

Style: Leisure

Colour:B lack red White

Size Information:
Size: S/M/L

Sexy Crop Top Bottoming
Inner Wear Outer Wear Top
$0.5 ~ SKU:9640287928612 

Product information:
Pattern: letters/numbers/text
Color: White
Elasticity: high elasticity
Size: S,M,L
Version: slim fit
Style type: Street hipster
Style: Sling style
Fabric name: Small sunken stripe
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Length: Short (40cm  Applicable Gender: Female
Applicable age group: Adult

 Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
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Sexy deep V-neck backless
suspender dress lace beach
dress
$12.97 ~ SKU:9648900112676 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 145 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Sexy hollow lace stitching
sports yoga leggings
$9.88 ~ SKU:9642502816036 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 30% Elastane/Spandex, 70% Cotton•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 131 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

These sexy cutout lace stitching sports yoga leggings are suitable
for many occasions! The simple design makes the boring season
interesting. There are a variety of collocation options that will
make you feel confident and beautiful. It has a comfortable fit
that won't restrict your movement. Key features include: -
comfortable fabric
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Sexy hot girl's one-piece
collared long-sleeved
sweater
$7.57 ~ SKU:9640184447268 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 350 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sexy hot girl's one-piece collared long-sleeved sweater. Please use
the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique

Sexy one-shoulder three-
dimensional floral long-
sleeved knitted top
$7.04 ~ SKU:9640184381732 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Nylon/Polyamide•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 187 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sexy one-shoulder three-dimensional floral long-sleeved knitted
top

Size Chart(inch)
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Sexy short-sleeved V-neck
dress, bohemian beach retro
floral skirt
$17.75 ~ SKU:9642527981860 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 254 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Sexy slim fit lace drawstring
long sleeve bottoming shirt
$3.18 ~ SKU:9640184578340 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 103 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sexy slim fit lace drawstring long sleeve bottoming shirt

Size Chart(inch)
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Sexy V-neck leather
sleeveless short section of a
hundred halter matte elastic
pu undershirt top
$3.19 ~ SKU:9640187560228 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% PU leather (polyurethane)•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Pu leather•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Composite material•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 91 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This women's sexy V-neck leather sleeveless short peplum halter

Sexy Women Plain Basic
Stretch T- Shirts Crop Top
Sweater
$2.07 ~ SKU:9640289337636 

Texture: Cashmere
Ingredient content: 96% and above

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and America
n people. Choose the larger size if your size between two sizes. Pl
ease allow 2-3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
 service.

3.As you know, the different computers display colors d
ifferently,  the color of the actual item may vary slightly 
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Sexy women's abstract
dazzling dizzy ripple print
halter neck tie top
$2.42 ~ SKU:9640187855140 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 60 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sexy women's abstract dazzing dizzy ripple print halter neck tie
top is suitable for many occasions, and the simple design makes
the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits

Shredded jeans
$9 ~ SKU:9883299316004 

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement.

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
service.

3.As you know, the different computers display colors differently,
  the color of the actual item may vary slightly from the following 
images.

 Comes with:
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Sleeveless crew neck racer
tank T-shirt
$2.67 ~ SKU:9640186970404 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 61 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

The new sleeveless round neck racer tank T-shirt is suitable for
many occasions, and the simple design makes the boring season
colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation options make
you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without restricting your

Slim Jeans Women Butterfly
Sticky Flower Beaded Split
Trousers
$7 ~ SKU:9883294335268 

Product information:
Thickness: thin
Fabric name: Denim
Color: black, dark blue, light blue
Elasticity: high elasticity
Main fabric composition: Cotton
Pants length: trousers
Waist Type: Mid waist
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Style type: temperament commute
Pants type: skinny pants
Popular elements: beaded
Style: pencil pants/skinny pants
Style: urban style
Process: stone washed

 Size:
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Slim short crop top
$0.97 ~ SKU:9640285274404 

Pattern: Print
Style: street
Style: Hedging
sleeve length: short sleeve
Process: Printing / Printing
Version: Slim fit
Collar type: round neck
Sleeve type: conventional sleeve
Popular elements: print, exposed
Style Type: Street hipsters

 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and America
n people. Choose the larger size if your size between two sizes. Pl
ease allow 2-3cm differences due to manual measurement.

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer

Sling outer wear small vest
with chest pad beautiful
back inner base
$2.4 ~ SKU:9640188510500 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 79 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Sling outer wear small vest with chest pad beautiful back inner
base. Please use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before
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Slit Micro High Waist Elastic
Hip Lifting Abdomen Dance
Casual Sports Trousers
$20.34 ~ SKU:9642504257828 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 79% Polyester, 21% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 350 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

The slit slightly flared pants high waist elastic hip lifting tummy
control dance casual sports wide leg trousers are suitable for a
variety of occasions. The simple design makes the boring season
colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation options make
you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without restricting your

Solid Color Backless High
Waist Bikini Split Swimsuit
$2.94 ~ SKU:9642325082404 

Product information:
Color: JP05BK,JP05BR, added Brown
Size: S,M,L,XL
Lining ingredients: nylon
Content of lining ingredients: 20
Style: briefs
Pattern style: solid color, sexy, backless, European and American
Lining name: Nylon
Fabric name: Nylon
Applicable scenario: swimming and wading Sports
Applicable Gender: Female
Applicable age: Adult
Fabric composition: nylon
Sleeve length: sleeveless

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
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Solid color inner and outer
wear slim-fit irregular
beautiful back tank top
$2.6 ~ SKU:9640188412196 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Square collar•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 89 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Solid color inner and outer wear slim-fit irregular beautiful back
tank top. Please use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before

Solid color letter bandage
cross crop top
$1.24 ~ SKU:9640289272100 

Fabric name: Cotton
Main fabric composition: cotton
The content of the main fabric ingredient: 71%-80%

Craft: Collage/Stitching 1.
 Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than Euro
pean and American people. Choose the larger 
size if your size between two sizes. Please allo
w  2 -
3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
 service.
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Solid Color Short Sleeve
Round Neck Pullover Top
$0.66 ~ SKU:9640286847268 

Product information:
Color: Lake blue, brown, green, apricot, red, Ginger yellow, size
S 0.18kg
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Style type: street fashion
Popular elements: Patch
Style: pullover
Fabric name: Polyester
Style: European and American style
Craft: collage/stitching

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you

Solid Color Simple Slim
Polo Shirt Short Sleeve
$2.83 ~ SKU:9640870707492 

Product information:
Color: brown, black
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Size: XS,S,M,L
Style type: temperament commute
Sleeve length: short sleeve
Style: Cardigan
Style: commute style

 Packing list:
 Short sleeve *1
  Product Image:
            Comes with:
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Solid color slim fit twist
halter top
$12.53 ~ SKU:9642340745508 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 8% Elastane/Spandex, 92% Viscose•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 164 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

Solid color stand collar
cotton jacket with loose
pockets and long sleeves
$27.71 ~ SKU:9642522444068 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 575 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The autumn and winter solid color stand-up collar padded jacket
with loose pockets and long sleeves is suitable for many
occasions. The simple design makes the boring season colorful
and interesting. A variety of matching options make you
confident and beautiful. Please use the sizing guide shown in our
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Spice Girls Short Vintage
Abstract Printed Sleeve
Short Top
$2.8 ~ SKU:9640187625764 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 78 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Personalised hot girl fashion clothing with comfortable and soft
fabric, sweat-absorbent and breathable, easy to care for.
Fashionable and simple shape design, highlighting the former

Spring and summer sexy
midriff-baring camisole
$8.44 ~ SKU:9642340024612 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 70 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust
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Spring and summer
temperament commuting V-
neck five-quarter sleeve top
$16.3 ~ SKU:9642524082468 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Short sleeve•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 240 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Spring and summer temperament commuting V-neck five-quarter
sleeve top

Spring and summer
temperament slim solid
color camisole
$10.7 ~ SKU:9642339926308 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 92% Polyester, 8% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 109 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Spring and summer
women's suspender cross
large V-neck backless lace-
up fashionable top
$12.81 ~ SKU:9642525524260 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Cotton•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 118 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The top adopts a large crossover V-neck design to highlight the
lines and curves of the chest, adding to women's sexiness and
elegance. The lace-up decoration on the back can add fashion and

Spring Summer Ladies Top
Solid Color Short Sexy Slim
Cross Pleated Vest
$3 ~ SKU:9640188051748 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 96 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Spring Summer Women's Tops Solid Color Short Sexy Slim
Cross Pleated Tank Top is suitable for many occasions, the
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Stand Collar Casual Cotton-
padded Coat Short Sports
Cotton-padded Jacket
$11.45 ~ SKU:9640869396772 

Product information:
Color: 1,2,3,3A,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,13A,15
Size: M,L,XL,XXL,3XL,4XL,5XL
Style: Cardigan
Fabric name: Polyester Fiber
Applicable scenarios: Leisure
Function: keep warm
Suitable season: Winter
Filler: Down
Lower hem design: straight hem

 Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please

Strap pajamas women's
long nightgown high-end
home service set
$21.34 ~ SKU:9648902078756 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 97% Polyester, 3% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Three quarter sleeves•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 334 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Suspender Pajamas Women's Long Nightgown
Advanced Sense Homewear Set is suitable for many occasions,
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Summer Beach Vest Printed
Dress Plus Size Women's
Clothing
$2.66 ~ SKU:9642325704996 

Product information:
Skirt type: suspender skirt
Color: blue, pink
Waist Type: Mid waist
Size: 1XL,2XL,3XL,4XL,5XL
Style type: temperament commute
Combination form: Single piece
Skirt length: mid-length skirt
Popular elements: digital printing
Style: Sling style
Fabric name: Polyester
Sleeve type: regular sleeve
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Sleeve length: sleeveless
Skirt Category: Dress
Style: urban style
Process: Printing

Summer New Hollow Spice
Girl Top Sexy Tight Halter
Neck Camisole
$3.5 ~ SKU:9640186872100 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The new summer hollowed-out babes sexy tight-fitting halter
neck camisole is suitable for many occasions, and the simple
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Summer New Women's
Wear Versatile Slim Fit
Letter Embroidery Sports
Tank Top
$2.52 ~ SKU:9640187789604 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 67 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Summer Pure Color Sequins
Sleeveless Sexy Round
Neck Splicing Sling Vest
$1.9 ~ SKU:9642315809060 

Product information:
Pattern: solid color
Fabric name: Polyester
Color: white, red, purple, green, black, gold, royal blue, Rose
Red, Lake Blue, Silver, Orange
Main fabric composition: Polyester Fiber (polyester)
Suitable age: 18-24 years old
Size: free size
Style: slim fit
Lining composition: Polyester Fiber (polyester)
Applicable age group: Adult
Popular elements: beads, sequins
Style: Sexy
Style: strap type

 Size:
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Suspender Sleeveless V-
neck Leopard Snake Print
Dress Fashion Sexy Midi
Dress
$11.99 ~ SKU:9648899359012 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Leopard print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 170 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Sweater spring new V-neck
drawstring crop topKnit
sweater pullover
$1.05 ~ SKU:9640286650660 

Fabric name: polyester fiber
pattern: plain
Thickness: moderate
Yarn thickness: ordinary yarn
Lining composition: polyester fiber (polyester)
Sweater Technology: Knitting
Combination form: single set
Style: Street
Style: Hedging
Version: Slim
Sleeve type: conventional sleeve
Collar type: V-neck
Sleeve length: long sleeve
Length of clothing: ordinary models (50cmlength≤65cm)
Process: Shirring
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Temperament cross-border
long sleeved small suit
jacket women's versatile
$19.24 ~ SKU:9642532602148 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Open front•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 325 g•
Pocket: Flap pocket•

Temperament cross-border long sleeved small suit jacket women's
versatile. Please use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before

Temperament Leisure Lace-
up Shirt Women's Clothing
$3.77 ~ SKU:9640870641956 

Product information:
Fabric name: Woven
Color: White
Main fabric composition: Polyester
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: temperament commute
Popular elements: shoulder strap
Style: Cardigan
Style: commuting style
Craft: mercerizing

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
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Textured-leather high-
stretch yoga pants
$19.79 ~ SKU:9642503110948 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Nylon/Polyamide, 20%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 170 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

High-stretch yoga pants with textured leather finish. Made from
knit fabric for optimal flexibility. Solid color suitable for various
leisure activities. Snug-fitting design accentuates your curves. No
pockets for a sleek and clean look. Ideal for yoga, gym, or casual
wear.

Trendy cotton and linen lazy
style pure color sleeveless
suspenders one-piece
overalls for women
$17.7 ~ SKU:9642527129892 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 224 g•
Pocket: Straight pocket•

The new trendy cotton and linen lazy style solid color sleeveless
suspenders one-piece overalls are suitable for many occasions.
The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
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V-neck halter chest bow
vest slim see-through sexy
backless top
$7.76 ~ SKU:9642339402020 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 47 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

This top features a V-neck and suspender design, with a cute bow
on the chest, adding a sweet and playful feel. The slim cut makes
the top fit the body lines and highlight women's curves. The see-
through design and backless details show a sexy and charming
effect, adding to the highlights of the outfit.

V-neck loose casual
pullover women's sweater
$18.95 ~ SKU:9648899850532 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woolen•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 318 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart (3)(inch)
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Woman'S Autumn New
Temperament Off-The-
Shoulder High-Waist Sexy
Dress
$23.64 ~ SKU:9642524279076 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Collar: V-neck•
Sleeve length: Short sleeve•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Weaving type: Woven•
Weight: 344 g•
Sleeve type: Bat sleeve•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Waistline: High waist•
Season: Four Seasons•
Style: Grace•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's jeans
$14 ~ SKU:9883296071972 

Fabric: Cotton denim
Color: dark blue, light blue, black gray, dark blue (knee hole),
light blue (knee hole), black gray (knee hole), dark blue (basic
model), light blue (basic model) ), black gray (basic)
Style: pencil pants
Thickness: conventional
Waist type: high waist

size recommended weight waist hips Thigh Front/rear pants length Foot mouth

S 75-92 62 78 44 26/32 90 22

M 93-103 66 80 47 26/33 90.5 23

L 104-113 70 83 50 27/33 91 24

XL 114-123 74 86 53 27/33 91.5 24

XXL 124-135 78 89 56 27/34 92 24



 
BarryBree Catalog

120

Women's Slub Cotton
Women's Flared Sleeve One-
Line Neck Sexy Top
$6.72 ~ SKU:9640188674340 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Sleeve type: Flared sleeve•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: One-shoulder•
Material: Rayon•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Retro•
Weight: 146 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Cotton blended fabric: breathable and sweat-absorbing, skin-
friendly, easy to care for. Washing method: dry clean, machine

Women's A- Line Umbrella
Skirt High Waist Midi Skirt
$2.5 ~ SKU:9642322428196 

Product information:
Fabric name: Polyester
Skirt-type: A- line skirt
Color: Multicolor
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: temperament commute
Skirt length: mid-length skirt
Skirt Category: skirt
Popular elements: 139500222
Style: Elegant style
Craft: Woven

 Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
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Women's All Over Floral
Print Holiday Slip Dress
$20.29 ~ SKU:9648902209828 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 340 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's Autumn Solid
Color Rib Knit Bootcut
Trousers
$3.67 ~ SKU:9883293843748 

Product information:
Color: light gray
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Style type: Japanese and Korean casual
Popular elements: Threads
Style: bootcut trousers
Fabric name: Polyester
Pants type: Light Miniature
Style: casual style
Craft: Rib

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
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Women's back -back band
sexy inner camisole vest
$2.37 ~ SKU:9640187494692 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 48 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This women's back-back band sexy inner camisole vest is made of
95% Polyester and 5% Elastane/Spandex. Featuring a flattering
design, it is perfect for layering and creating a stylish look.
Suitable for various occasions and seasons, this versatile top will

Women's bateau neck lace
patchwork long-sleeved T-
shirt
$3.6 ~ SKU:9640184676644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 97% Polyester, 3% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's bateau neck lace patchwork long-sleeved T-shirt

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Black And White
Contrast Sweater Cardigan
$15.89 ~ SKU:9642529947940 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Open front•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Color block•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woolen•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 200 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Stylish color block design, perfect for autumn-winter. This
cardigan features an open front for easy layering. Crafted from
soft, woolen knit polyester material. Designed with a contrast of
black and white. Ideal for casual outings, office, or cozy home

Women's boat neck sexy
lace patchwork long-sleeved
sweater top
$2.98 ~ SKU:9640184643876 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 97% Polyester, 3% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 139 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's boat neck sexy lace patchwork long-sleeved sweater top

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's bra cup applique
waist strap hot girl butt-
covering dress short dress
$14.48 ~ SKU:9642523754788 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 166 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The hot girl's hip-hugging dress with breast cup appliqués and
straps highlights a woman's upper body curves and breast lines,
showing her sexy and charming charm. Lace-up design adds a
feminine touch of romance.

Women's casual deep V bell
sleeve strappy top
$3.34 ~ SKU:9640188477732 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 124 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's casual hollow
drawstring suspender
woolen vest
$9.47 ~ SKU:9642338812196 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 130 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's casual hollow drawstring suspender woolen vest. Please
use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique

Women's casual loose
contrast color hooded jacket
$27.55 ~ SKU:9648902111524 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Viscose•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Hooded•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Lattice•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 800 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Casual Sequined
Denim Straight Pants
$28.39 ~ SKU:9642522870052 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 491 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

These trousers have a straight-leg design with a loose, natural fit.
Straight-leg pants are suitable for all body shapes, and the
comfortable and loose design makes wearing them more
comfortable and easy. Sequin decoration can attract the eye and
add highlights and fashion to the overall look. These trousers are
suitable for casual occasions, such as daily outings, parties, etc.
Pair it with a top and shoes for a stylish yet casual look.

Women's Casual Sleeveless
Leopard Print Pocket Loose
Suspender Jumpsuit
$16.57 ~ SKU:9648900440356 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Leopard print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 318 g•
Pocket: Seam pocket•

Women's Casual Sleeveless Leopard Print Side Pocket Loose
Suspender Jumpsuit with stylish style and soft and comfortable
fabric. It can be worn for daily, dating, going out, vacation and so
on. Washing method can be machine wash or hand wash. Fabric
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Women's casual solid color
slim fit long sleeve knitted
T-shirt
$11.74 ~ SKU:9648902308132 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 92% Polyester, 8% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 130 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's casual sports
pants with stitching and
webbing sweatpants
$16.23 ~ SKU:9648901554468 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 370 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's casual striped
suspender woolen vest top
$8.99 ~ SKU:9642338353444 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 140 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's casual striped suspender woolen vest top. Please use
the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique
design, classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for
outing and leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error

Women's Casual Vintage
Workwear Wide Leg Loose
Straight Jeans
$19.87 ~ SKU:9642527260964 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 60% Cotton, 40% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Cotton•
Waistline: Mid waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 361 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

•With multi-pocket design, it is conceivable that pockets are an
essential element of overalls. Large and small pockets for
decoration make the overalls even more valuable. •Pairing with t-
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Women's casual zipper
camisole top
$8.41 ~ SKU:9642337272100 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 154 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's casual zipper camisole top

Size Chart(inch)
Size US UK Length Bust

women's color block long
sleeve turtleneck sweater
women's fashion
$18.75 ~ SKU:9642522771748 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Random print•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woolen•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 291 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Fashionable Style/ Casual And Versatile/ Suitable For Daily
Wear/ School/ Leisure/ Vacation/ Date/ Party/ Club/ Etc/
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Women's contrast color
casual pullover long sleeve
shirt
$18.5 ~ SKU:9648901751076 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Lattice•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 410 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's Contrasting Color
Lace Sexy Lingerie
$2.85 ~ SKU:9640187887908 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Floral•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 68 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Contrasting color lace sexy underwear, fashionable, beautiful and
versatile. The fabric is elastic, soft and comfortable, and skin-
friendly. Whether it is daily, shopping, dating, etc., it can be
worn by machine or hand. Fabric is wrinkle resistant and resistant
to pilling. The size is measured by hand, and it is normal for there
to be an error of 1-3cm. Can be worn on dates, everyday casual,
etc.
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Women's Cute Fashion V-
neck Strawberry Mesh
Stitching One-piece
$4.75 ~ SKU:9642329768228 

Product information:
Thickness: medium
Fabric name: Mesh
Color: pink, L :0.32kg
Elasticity: Micro elasticity
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Pants length: Hot pants
Waist type: high waist
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style type: fresh and sweet
Popular elements: zipper
Style: Lolita
Style: Jumpsuit
Craft: collage/stitching

 Size:
   Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European

Women's design sequined
backless camisole
$7.57 ~ SKU:9642337009956 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 63 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's design sequined backless camisole, the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
matching options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the sizing guide shown in our images. Please read each element of
the sizing guide carefully before choosing a size. The size is
measured manually, and there is an error of 1-3cm, which is
normal. Key features include. - Comfortable fabric Can be worn
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Women's elegant solid color
buttoned waist top
$15.27 ~ SKU:9648901292324 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 201 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's elegant solid color buttoned waist top

Size Chart(inch)

Women's elegant solid color
metal buckle one-shoulder
blouse
$6.93 ~ SKU:9640188313892 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Off-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 162 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's elegant solid color metal buckle one-shoulder blouse
with fashionable style and soft and comfortable fabric. Whether it
is daily, going out, or working, it can be worn, and the washing
method can be machine washed or hand washed. Fabric is wrinkle
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Women's ethnic style
printed suspender dress
$16.14 ~ SKU:9648901718308 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Vacation•
Weight: 260 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's Fashion Y2k Street
Sleeveless Letter Printed
Vest Top
$9.39 ~ SKU:9642339369252 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Letter•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 73 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Floral Print
Sleeveless Waist Bohemian
Dress
$15.68 ~ SKU:9648900505892 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 162 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's Gold Velvet
Casual Swing Collar blouse
$18 ~ SKU:9648900833572 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 385 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Women's Gold Velvet Casual Swing Collar blouse. Please use
the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique
design, classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for
outing and leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error
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Women's halter neck tie
printed butterfly tank top
$2.92 ~ SKU:9640187756836 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 37 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's halter neck tie printed butterfly tank top with a stylish
style and soft and comfortable fabric. It can be worn daily, going
out, dating, parties, etc., and the washing method can be machine
wash or hand wash. Fabric is wrinkle resistant and resistant to
pilling. The size is measured by hand, and it is normal for there to
be an error of 1-3cm.

Women's high -necked
sleeveless navel irregular
hem top
$2.92 ~ SKU:9640187199780 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Turtleneck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 86 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Elevate your wardrobe with this chic Women's high-necked
sleeveless top, featuring an irregular hem and a flattering navel-
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Women's holiday casual
sexy V-neck printed lace-up
midi dress
$18.35 ~ SKU:9642526408996 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Deep V•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 350 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

women's hooded pit knitted
sweater cardigan coat
$26.2 ~ SKU:9642526179620 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Random print•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woolen•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 546 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Fashionable Style/ Casual And Versatile/ Suitable For Daily
Wear/ School/ Leisure/ Vacation/ Date/ Party/ Club/ Etc/
Please Refer To The Left Size Picture Before Purchasing/ Due
To Different Computer Display Colors/ The Actual Product
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Women's Hoodie Button-
Down Casual Shirt Jacket
$7.72 ~ SKU:9640188543268 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 65% Cotton, 35% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Slit sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Hooded•
Material: Cotton•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Plaid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 320 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

The upper coat is designed to provide a flattering and elegant
look. Show good shape. Sleek sleeves for easy dressing up.
Perfect with shorts, skinny jeans, boots, leggings for a chic look.
This women's top is very fashionable and cute, suitable for casual,

Women's Hot Girl Style Sexy
Irregular Hollow Hollow
Knitted Blouse
$6.8 ~ SKU:9640184807716 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's hottie style sexy irregular holed hollow knitted blouse.
The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention
to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
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Women's irregular lower
back -back lace -up ruffled
upper
$2.81 ~ SKU:9640187068708 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Ruffle sleeve•
Clothing type: T•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Short sleeve•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 79 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Women's irregular lower back lace-up ruffled top is a stylish
addition to any wardrobe. The unique lace-up back adds a touch

Women's jeans ripped holes
are thinner women's jeans
$8 ~ SKU:9883299447076 

Fabric name: denim
Main fabric composition: cotton
Main fabric ingredient content: 81%-90%

   1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 

2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
service.

3.As you know, the different computers display colors differently,
  the color of the actual item may vary slightly from the following 
images.
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Women's Knitted Drawstring
Thread Sexy Casual All-
Match Navel Vest
$3 ~ SKU:9640186904868 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 92%rayon 8%spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Basic•
Weight: 106 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Knitted Drawstring Thread Sexy Casual All-Match
Navel Vest  Material: soft and comfortable, easy to care 

Women's Knitted Half
Cardigan Small Flying
Sleeve Short Vest
$3.54 ~ SKU:9640187986212 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester5%spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: Y•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Half sleeve•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 97 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Knitted Half Cardigan Small Flying Sleeve Short Vest 
Material: soft and comfortable, easy to care  Features: Daily,
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Women's Knitted Sexy
Backless Waffle Halter Vest
$3.14 ~ SKU:9640187724068 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester5%spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: Y•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 126 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Knitted Sexy Backless Waffle Halter Vest  Material:
soft and comfortable, easy to care  Features: Daily, Casual
Fashion, Versatile, Waffle, Sexy  Occasion: leisure, going out,
school, work, dating, party, travel, vacation, office, etc.  Washing

Women's Knitted Sexy
Square Neck Open Back
Cropped Vest
$3.12 ~ SKU:9640187298084 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95%rayon5%spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Square collar•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 105 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Knitted Sexy Square Neck Open Back Cropped Vest 
Material: soft and comfortable, easy to care  Features: Daily,
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Women's Lace Button Print
Sleeveless Vest Cropped
Top T-Shirt
$6.47 ~ SKU:9640188739876 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 39 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's Lace Button Printed Sleeveless Vest Cropped Top T-
shirt is suitable for a variety of scenes. The simple design makes
the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of matching
options make you confident and beautiful. Please use the sizing
guide shown in our images when purchasing. Please read each

Women's lace sexy back
suspender vest
$2.72 ~ SKU:9640187461924 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 78 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Women's lace sexy back suspender vest features a delicate
lace pattern, making it a perfect choice for adding a touch of
elegance to any outfit. Pair it with high-waisted jeans or a skirt
for a stylish look. Suitable for all seasons, this versatile vest is a
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Women's Lace-Up Bow V-
Neck Camisole Top
$3.37 ~ SKU:9640188117284 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 109 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's V-neck camisole top with tie bowknot, fashionable
style, soft and comfortable fabric. It can be worn daily, going out,
dating, vacation, etc. Washing method can be machine wash or
hand wash. Fabric is wrinkle and pill resistant. The size is

Women's Long Sleeve Crop
Top T-Shirts
$1.33 ~ SKU:9640289239332 

Made of: Cotton
Ingredient content: 96% and above
Size: S M L XL
Main color: Black Khaki Red Stripes
1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
 American people. Choose the larger size if your size be
tween two sizes. Please allow 2-
3cm differences due to manual measurement. 

 
2. Please check the size chart carefully before you buy the item, if
 you don't know how to choose size, please contact our customer
 service.

 
3.As you know, the different computers display colors differently,
 the color of the actual item may vary slightly from the following i
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Women's loose flared long-
sleeved top
$16.73 ~ SKU:9648900374820 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 260 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's loose hollow long-
sleeved woolen top
$6.72 ~ SKU:9640184480036 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Acrylic•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 160 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's loose hollow long-sleeved woolen top. Please use the
size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please
read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design,
classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and
leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is
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women's loose hooded
sweater cardigan sweater
$24.86 ~ SKU:9648899260708 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 605 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

women's loose hooded sweater cardigan sweater. Please use the
size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please
read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design,
classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and
leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is

Women's new autumn and
winter plaid woolen jacket
$20.52 ~ SKU:9642525950244 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Lattice•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 428 g•
Pocket: Flap pocket•

Women's new autumn and winter plaid woolen jacket, the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. When
purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the appropriate
size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each element in the
size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured
manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal. In addition, it is
important to understand the material and care requirements of
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Women's new autumn and
winter simple long-sleeved
lapel button slit woolen
jacket
$25.84 ~ SKU:9642522706212 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 732 g•
Pocket: Flap pocket•

Women's new autumn and winter simple long-sleeved lapel
button slit woolen jacket. The simple design makes the boring
season colorful and interesting. When purchasing, it is

Women's new black
suspender midi dress
$19.91 ~ SKU:9648899162404 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 363 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new black suspender mid-length dress, the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. When
purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the appropriate
size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each element in the
size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured
manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal. In addition, it is
important to understand the material and care requirements of
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Women's new bohemian v-
neck ethnic style floral
dress
$15.31 ~ SKU:9642528932132 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Rayon•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Rayon•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 155 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's New Casual
Button Long Sleeve Woolen
Cardigan Top
$7.16 ~ SKU:9640184709412 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% Viscose•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 216 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new casual button long-sleeved woolen cardigan top,
the simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention
to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
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Women's new casual
fashion resort style printed
tube top dress
$12.91 ~ SKU:9648900702500 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 99 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new casual and fashionable holiday style printed tube
top dress, the simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention
to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes

Women's New Casual
Hollow Strap Camisole
Woolen Vest
$12.5 ~ SKU:9642338517284 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% Viscose•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 82 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new casual hollow lace-up suspender woolen vest, the
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting.
When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the
appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
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Women's new casual solid
color slim fit front slit
leggings
$14.75 ~ SKU:9642503930148 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 225 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's new casual solid color slim-fit front slit leggings, the
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting.
When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the
appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes

Women's new fashionable
round neck big bow long-
sleeved sexy see-through
short top
$3.46 ~ SKU:9640184545572 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 180 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new fashionable round neck big bow long-sleeved sexy
see-through short top , simple design makes the boring season
colorful and interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to
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Women's New Fashionable
Round Neck Spliced Long
Sleeve Sweater
$3.8 ~ SKU:9640184414500 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 198 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new fashionable round neck patchwork long-sleeved
sweater is suitable for a variety of scenes. The simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
matching options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the sizing guide shown in our images when purchasing. Please

Women's new lamb wool
short coat zipper motorcycle
style jacket top
$32.21 ~ SKU:9642528112932 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% PU•
Clothing type: H•
Material: PU•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Composite material•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 809 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Women's new lamb wool short coat zipper motorcycle style
jacket top makes you confident and beautiful. Please use the
sizing guide shown in our images. Please read each element of the
sizing guide carefully before choosing a size. The size is measured
manually, and there is an error of 1-3cm, which is normal. Key
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Women's New Long Sleeve
Lace Hollow Cardigan Slim
Fit Top for Hot Girls
$3.19 ~ SKU:9640184742180 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 50% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 110 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new long-sleeved lace hollow cardigan slim fit hot girl
outfit top, the simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention
to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes

Women's new long-sleeved
suit collar double-breasted
woolen coat top
$25.8 ~ SKU:9648902865188 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 730 g•
Pocket: Flap pocket•

Women's new long-sleeved suit collar double-breasted woolen
jacket top, the simple design makes the boring season colorful
and interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay
attention to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please
read each element in the size guide carefully before choosing a
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Women's new mini inverted
triangle round neck elastic
slim fit sleeveless short vest
top
$7.34 ~ SKU:9642337960228 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 63% Polyester, 3% Elastane/Spandex,
34% Cotton

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 80 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new mini inverted triangle round neck elastic slim
sleeveless short vest top, suitable for various occasions, the right

Women's new sexy retro
waist slim pleated dress
$18.41 ~ SKU:9642531684644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 358 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new sexy retro waist slim pleated dress, the simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety
of matching options make you confident and beautiful. Please use
the sizing guide shown in our images when purchasing. Please
read each element in the size guide carefully before choosing a
size. Sizes are measured manually, and an error of 1-3cm is
normal.
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Women's new simple solid
color pull-sleeve V-neck
button lapel shirt
$11.89 ~ SKU:9648901652772 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Lapel collar•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 179 g•
Pocket: Straight pocket•

Women's new simple solid color pull-sleeve V-neck button-up
lapel shirt is suitable for many occasions. The simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits

Women's New Sleeveless
Waist Solid Color Hollow
Splicing Printed Dress
$20.22 ~ SKU:9642523820324 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 323 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's new sling hottie
lace jumpsuit
$8.13 ~ SKU:9642337403172 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 78 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new suspender hottie lace jumpsuit, the simple design
makes the boring season colorful and interesting. When
purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the appropriate
size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each element in the
size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes are measured
manually, and an error of 1-3cm is normal. In addition, it is
important to understand the material and care requirements of

Women's new street casual
outer wear slim sports style
hot girl suspenders contrast
color jumpsuit
$11.04 ~ SKU:9648899948836 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 124 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's new stretch slim
fit spliced high waist flared
denim trousers
$24.52 ~ SKU:9648900342052 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Elastane/Spandex, 95% Cotton•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 538 g•
Pocket: Welt pocket•

Women's new stretch slim-fit splicing high-waisted flared denim
trousers. The simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention
to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes

Women's New Versatile
Button Camisole Woolen
Vest
$9.44 ~ SKU:9642338844964 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 5% Polyester, 95% Viscose•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 99 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's new all-match buttoned suspender woolen vest, the
simple design makes the boring season colorful and interesting.
When purchasing, it is recommended to pay attention to the
appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit. Please read each
element in the size guide carefully before choosing a size. Sizes
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Women's one piece ethnic
print beach skirt
$15.15 ~ SKU:9648902013220 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Paisley•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 209 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's one piece ethnic print beach skirt featuring a stylish
silhouette in a soft and comfortable fabric. It can be worn daily,
going out, dating, vacation, etc., and the washing method can be
machine wash or hand wash. Fabric is wrinkle resistant and
resistant to pilling. The size is measured by hand, and it is normal
for there to be an error of 1-3cm.

Women's pink chiffon
pullover slimming floral mid-
waist dress
$13.58 ~ SKU:9648901030180 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Three quarter sleeves•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 187 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's pink chiffon pullover slimming floral mid-waist dress.
Please use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing
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Women's pitted U-neck
long-sleeved solid color
navel-baring French T-shirt
$3.24 ~ SKU:9640185233700 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 50% Polyester, 25% Elastane/Spandex,
25% Cotton

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 144 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's striped U-neck long-sleeved solid-color navel-baring
French T-shirt. The simple design makes the boring season
colorful and interesting. When purchasing, it is recommended to
pay attention to the appropriate size to ensure comfort and fit.

Women's Plant Element
Print Beach Vacation
Suspender Top Shorts Two-
piece Set
$13.2 ~ SKU:9648899784996 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 154 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's printed bottoming
quick-drying shorts yoga
pants casual sports waist
elastic shorts
$10.09 ~ SKU:9642523951396 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 123 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Women's printed bottoming quick-drying shorts yoga pants
casual sports waist drawstring elastic shorts are suitable for many
occasions, the simple design makes the boring season colorful and

Women's Printed Chiffon
Sexy Dresss
$14.18 ~ SKU:9648900145444 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Flared sleeve•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Cross neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Short sleeve•
Pattern: Small flower•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 254 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Printed Chiffon Sexy Dress Delicate small flower
pattern creates a feminine look. Short sleeves and flowy
silhouette offer comfort. No elasticity fabric ensures a flattering
Bohemia fit. Elegant V-neck design adds a touch of allure. Perfect



 
BarryBree Catalog

158

Women's ranch style solid
color suspender tied waist
dress
$19.67 ~ SKU:9642530832676 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Viscose•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Bohemia•
Weight: 360 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's ranch style solid color suspender tied waist dress

Size Chart(inch)

Women's Resort Elegant U
Neck Printed Halter Long
Dress
$19.54 ~ SKU:9642526998820 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Full body print•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 350 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Retro Patchwork
Women's One-piece Suit
Beachwear Swimsuit
$1.96 ~ SKU:9642327605540 

Product information:
Pattern: Leopard print
Color: Figure 1, figure 2, Figure 3
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Lining composition: Polyester Fiber (polyester)
Style: one-piece swimsuit
Lining name: Polyester
Category: one-piece swimsuit
Fabric name: Polyester
Applicable scenario: swimming and wading Sports
Applicable Gender: Female
Applicable age: Adult
Fabric composition: chlorine fiber (polyvinyl chloride fiber)

 Size:

Women's ripped jeans
$11 ~ SKU:9883299545380 

 Material: Polyester
 Length: Full Length
 Model Number: 1PC Women Shorts
 Style: Casual
 Fabric Type: Softener
 Waist Type: Mid
 Closure Type: Zipper Fly
 Decoration: Pockets
 Decoration: HOLE
 Decoration: Fake Zippers
 Decoration: Washed
 Jeans Style: Pencil Pants
 Fit Type: skinny
 Wash: Light
 Style: Casual,Fashion,Fitness,Sports
 Pattern Type: Solid Color
 Occasion: Daily,Casual,Running

1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
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Women's round neck bow A-
line mid-length dresses
$20.22 ~ SKU:9642525393188 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Regular sleeve•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Long sleeves•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 367 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

 Material: Soft and comfortable, easy to care  Features: Basic,
casual and stylish  Washing method: hand wash and machine
wash, the water temperature should not exceed 42 degrees 
Fashion, casual, charming, elegant  Accessories and jewelry,
clutches and high heels.  Occasion: Casual, Daily, Cocktail

Women's round neckless
sleeve navel short back top
jacket
$2.83 ~ SKU:9640187265316 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 82 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Stay chic and trendy with our Women's round neck sleeveless
crop top jacket. Made from a blend of 95% Polyester and 5%
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Women's Seamless Gradient
Slim Body Quick-drying
Sexy Peach Hip Sports
Fitness Pants
$15.81 ~ SKU:9642502684964 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Waistline: High waist•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 231 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Seamless Gradient Slim Body Quick-drying Sexy

Women's Seamless High
Waist Gradient Color
Seamless Sports Yoga
Pants
$13.49 ~ SKU:9642503307556 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Keep•
Weight: 219 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's seamless high-rise ombré non-marking sports yoga
pants with a stylish style and soft and comfortable fabric. Can be
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Women's sexy back lace
hollow stitching tube top top
$2.69 ~ SKU:9640187527460 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Off-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 66 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Women's sexy back lace hollow stitching tube top features a
sleek silhouette and is made of 95% Polyester, 5%
Elastane/Spandex. Pair it with high-waisted jeans or a skirt for a
stylish look. Perfect for summertime events and dates.

Women's sexy backless
shoulder strap tube top top
$2.59 ~ SKU:9640187363620 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Off-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 50 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Crafted from a blend of 95% Polyester and 5% Elastane, this
Women's sexy backless shoulder strap tube top delivers a sultry
silhouette. Perfect for evening events or a night out, this top pairs
effortlessly with high-waisted bottoms for a stylish look.
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Women's sexy camisole
solid color V-neck camisole
T-shirt
$3.28 ~ SKU:9640187953444 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 80% Polyester, 20% Cotton•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 119 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's sexy camisole solid color V-neck camisole T-shirt is
suitable for many occasions, and the simple design makes the
boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of collocation
options make you confident and beautiful. It fits snugly without

Women's sexy cross -
hanging neck showed
irregular top
$2.58 ~ SKU:9640187330852 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Halter neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 57 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This women's sexy cross-hanging neck top showcases an irregular
design, perfect for adding a touch of edgy style to any outfit.



 
BarryBree Catalog

164

Women's Sexy Elegant Deep
V Long Sleeve Hollow Beach
Dress
$23.56 ~ SKU:9642531586340 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Waistline: High waist•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 354 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Effortless elegance shines through in this Ladies Sexy Deep V
Long Sleeve Hollow Beach Dress. Featuring a flowy, lace design
with a V-neckline and button details, it’s perfect for spring-

Women's sexy low-cut mid-
length camisole dress
$14.41 ~ SKU:9648901390628 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 174 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

 Material: Soft and comfortable, easy to care  Features: Basic,
casual and stylish  Washing method: hand wash and machine
wash, the water temperature should not exceed 42 degrees 
Fashion, casual, charming, elegant  Accessories and jewelry,
clutches and high heels.  Occasion: Casual, Daily, Cocktail
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Women's sexy off-shoulder
dress
$17.21 ~ SKU:9648899883300 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 250 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Sexy One-Neck
Hollow Navel knit top
$2.72 ~ SKU:9640185004324 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 90 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Sexy One-Neck Hollow Navel knit top. Please use the
size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please
read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design,
classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and
leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is
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Women's sexy satin silky
sexy tank top
$2.95 ~ SKU:9640188182820 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester5%spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Cute•
Weight: 44 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's sexy satin silky sexy tank top  Material: soft and
comfortable, easy to care  Features: sexy, cute  Occasion: leisure,
going out, school, work, dating, party, travel, vacation, office,
etc.  Washing method: wash and dry / separate dark / light

Women's Sexy Sling Solid
Color Sleeveless Tank Top
$2.35 ~ SKU:9640187429156 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Collar: Sling•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Weaving type: Knit•
Weight: 39 g•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Waistline: High waist•
Season: Four Seasons•
Style: Leisure•
Pocket: No pockets•

• Loose fit fits most body types • Chic style, loved by customers,
looks textured and refined • Lightweight and stylish fabric, very
comfortable and high quality, stretchy, suitable for most people •
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Women's sexy solid color U-
neck slit dress
$15.07 ~ SKU:9648901685540 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 94% Polyester, 6% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: U neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Autumn-Winter•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 310 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Size Chart(inch)

Women's sexy suspender
lace lace-up see-through
vest
$8.89 ~ SKU:9642339107108 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 80 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's sexy suspender lace lace-up see-through vest. Please
use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique



 
BarryBree Catalog

168

Women's sexy suspender
lace lace-up vest
$11.03 ~ SKU:9642338976036 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 120 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's sexy suspender lace lace-up vest. Please use the size
guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please read
each element of the size guide carefully. Unique design, classic
style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure.
The size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is normal.

Women's shattered sexy
umbilical camisole top
$2.88 ~ SKU:9640187167012 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Sling•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Floral•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 51 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Women's shattered sexy umbilical camisole top is made of
95% Polyester and 5% Elastane/Spandex, creating a sleek and
form-fitting silhouette. Perfect for pairing with high-waisted
bottoms, this top is ideal for summer nights out or beach parties.
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Women's short sexy solid
color slim pleated halter top
$6.54 ~ SKU:9640187396388 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 111 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Casual tops, fashionable, versatile. The fabric is very stretchy and
the fabric is soft and comfortable. Whether it is daily leisure, or
shopping, sports, climbing, etc. can be worn, washing can be
machine washable or hand washable. The fabric is not easy to

Women's shoulder strap
navel sexy backless vest
$2.21 ~ SKU:9640187232548 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Off-shoulder•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 46 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This Women's shoulder strap navel sexy backless vest is made
from a blend of 95% Polyester and 5% Elastane/Spandex for a
comfortable fit. The design features a flattering silhouette, perfect
for everyday wear or special occasions. The unique pattern and
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Women's sleeveless lotus
leaf edge hem pure color
round neck top
$2.93 ~ SKU:9640187134244 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 60% Polyester, 40% Viscose•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Cotton•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 89 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Crafted with a blend of 60% Polyester and 40% Viscose, this
women's sleeveless top features a stylish lotus leaf edge hem and

Women's sleeveless navel
simple inner top
$3.21 ~ SKU:9640187035940 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 55% Polyester, 40% Cotton, 5%
Elastane/Spandex

•

Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: T•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 160 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

This women's sleeveless navel simple inner top is perfect for
adding a touch of elegance to your outfit. Made with a mix of
polyester, cotton, and elastane, this top is both comfortable and
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Women's Sleeveless Top
Summer Multicolor Casual
Stitching Vest
$12.21 ~ SKU:9648900243748 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Cotton•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Cotton•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Romantic•
Weight: 151 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Sleeveless Tops Summer Multicolor Casual Paneling
Tank Top is suitable for many occasions, the simple design makes
the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety of
collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits
snugly without restricting your movement. Key features include. -

Women's slim fit hollow
sexy denim vest
$6.29 ~ SKU:9640188772644 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% polyester•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Four Seasons•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's hollow sexy denim vest. Please use the size guide
shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size, please read each
element of the size guide carefully. Unique design, classic style,
casual and comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure. The
size is measured manually, and the error of 1-3cm is normal.
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Women's Solid Color Cotton
Linen Drawstring Loose
Casual Wide Leg Trousers
$12.49 ~ SKU:9642523296036 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 218 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Women's Solid Color Cotton Linen Drawstring Loose Casual
Wide Leg Trousers. Please use the size guide shown in our
pictures. Before choosing a size, please read each element of the
size guide carefully. Unique design, classic style, casual and
comfortable. It is suitable for outing and leisure. The size is

Women's Solid Color
Pleated Design Square Neck
Versatile Simple Camisole
$10.27 ~ SKU:9642340385060 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 81 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's solid color sexy
trendy midriff-baring short
vest
$9.55 ~ SKU:9642338877732 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 100 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's solid color sexy and trendy midriff-baring short vest,
the simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. A variety of matching options make you confident
and beautiful. Please use the sizing guide shown in our images
when purchasing. Please read each element in the size guide

Women's Solid Color
Sleeveless Hollow Slim
Wool Vest Top
$3.67 ~ SKU:9640188150052 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Turtleneck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 122 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Solid color sleeveless cutout slim fit woolen vest top
with fashionable style and soft and comfortable fabric. It can be
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Women's Solid Color Snap
Button Casual Sleeveless
Tank Top
$3.62 ~ SKU:9640188215588 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: X•
Collar: Round neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 187 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Solid Color Snap Button Casual Sleeveless Tank Top
with stylish style and soft and comfortable fabric. It can be worn

Women's Solid Color
Texture One Shoulder Tank
Top
$2.74 ~ SKU:9640186839332 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: X•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 150 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's Solid textured one-shoulder tank top featuring a trendy
style and soft, comfortable fabric. It can be worn daily, going out,
dating, vacation, etc. Washing method can be machine wash or
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Women's solid color tight
short tube top
$9.91 ~ SKU:9642339074340 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 8% Elastane/Spandex, 92% Viscose•
Clothing type: S•
Material: Viscose fiber•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 97 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

The top is designed with a tight-fitting short that fits the curves
of the body and highlights the graceful lines of the body. This top
can be matched with a variety of bottoms, such as shorts, skirts,
jeans, etc., to suit different occasions and seasonal needs. You
can also choose to match it with outerwear, shoes and accessories
to create different styles and looks.

Women's Solid Color V-neck
Long Sleeve Dress
$15.65 ~ SKU:9648899457316 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 70% Polyester, 30% Cotton•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: A•
Collar: V-neck•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 269 g•
Pocket: Slant pocket•

Women's solid color V-neck mid-sleeve dress with fashionable
style and soft and comfortable fabric. It can be worn for daily,
dating, going out, vacation and so on. Washing method can be
machine wash or hand wash. Fabric resists wrinkling and pilling.
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Women's Sports Jogging
Loose Sweatpants
$6.45 ~ SKU:9883294040356 

Product information:
Thickness: thick
Fabric name: space Cotton
Color: black, gray, blue, red, rose
Elasticity: Micro elasticity
Main fabric composition: Polyester (polyester fiber)
Pants length: trousers
Waist type: high waist
Size: S,M,L,XL,XXL
Version: Straight
Style type: Japanese and Korean casual
Pants type: straight-leg pants
Style: casual style
Craft: collage/stitching

 Size:
  Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual

Women's Stretch Hip Lifting
Yoga Pants High Waist Tight
Peach Pants Quick Dry
Sweatpants
$12.74 ~ SKU:9642503569700 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Nylon•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: High elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sports•
Weight: 166 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Fitness Pants Women's Stretch Hip Lifting Yoga Pants High
Waist Tight Peach Pants Quick Dry Sweatpants are suitable for
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Women's Striped Halter
Neck Sleeveless Dress
$14.16 ~ SKU:9648902406436 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: A•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Stripe•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 199 g•
Pocket: No-back-pocket•

Women's striped halterneck sleeveless dress is suitable for many
occasions, the simple design makes the boring season colorful and
interesting. A variety of collocation options make you confident
and beautiful. Please use the size guide shown in our images.
Please read each element in the size guide carefully before
choosing a size. The size is measured manually, and it is normal
for there to be an error of 1-3cm. Key features include. -

Women's Tie Dye High Waist
Training Sport Yoga Fitness
Pants
$14.49 ~ SKU:9642503962916 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 10% Elastane/Spandex, 90%
Nylon/Polyamide

•

Clothing type: S•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: Moderate elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Keep•
Weight: 161 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's tie dye high waist training sport yoga workout pants
with stylish style and soft and comfortable fabric. Can be worn
for daily, sports, fitness, etc. Washing method can be machine
wash or hand wash. Fabric is wrinkle and pill resistant. The size is
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Women's Top Swing Collar
Design Sense Drawstring
Sexy Low Cut Short Vest
$3.51 ~ SKU:9640188018980 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% Polyester, 5% Elastane/Spandex•
Clothing type: S•
Collar: Cowl neck•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Sexy•
Weight: 129 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's blouse with swing neck design and drawstring sexy low-
cut cropped camisole is suitable for many occasions. The simple
design makes the boring season colorful and interesting. A variety
of collocation options make you confident and beautiful. It fits

Women's twist button loose
knitted cardigan
$26.16 ~ SKU:9648899326244 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 561 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's twist button loose knitted cardigan

Size Chart(inch)
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Women's Velvet Heart neck
small suspender vest
$2.64 ~ SKU:9640189362468 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 100% Polyester•
Sleeve type: Sleeveless•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Solid•
Fabric elasticity: No elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Woven•
Style: Grace•
Weight: 76 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Material: Crafted from luxurious velvet, this vest is soft to the
touch and offers a comfortable fit. Design: Featuring a heart-
shaped neckline and small suspenders, this vest exudes a
charming and unique style. Styling: Pair this vest with a skirt or
high-waisted pants for a trendy and feminine look. Occasion:

Women's V-neck loose long-
sleeved T-shirt button top
$15.16 ~ SKU:9642523459876 

Sizing: True to size•
Material composition: 95% polyester, 5% spandex•
Sleeve type: Dropped shoulder sleeves•
Clothing type: H•
Material: Polyester•
Sleeve length: Sleeveless•
Pattern: Self design•
Fabric elasticity: Slight elasticity•
Season: Spring-Summer•
Weaving type: Knit•
Style: Leisure•
Weight: 296 g•
Pocket: No pockets•

Women's V-neck loose long-sleeved T-shirt button top. Please
use the size guide shown in our pictures. Before choosing a size,
please read each element of the size guide carefully. Unique
design, classic style, casual and comfortable. It is suitable for
outing and leisure. The size is measured manually, and the error



 
BarryBree Catalog

180

Women's Y2g Lace Hollow
Out V-neck Cardigan Lace-
up Long Sleeve Top
$1.08 ~ SKU:9640287273252 

Product information:
Pattern: plants and flowers
Fabric name: knitted
Color: white main fabric composition: acrylic
Size: S,M,L,XL
Style: slim fit
Length: Short (40cm  Applicable Gender: Female
Style type: street fashion
Popular elements: lace-up

 Note:  1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item

Youth Spring And Autumn
Sportswear Suit
$13.6 ~ SKU:9640870183204 

Product information:
Fabric name: Cotton
Applicable scenario: Sports
Color: Black
Top sleeve length: long sleeve
Main fabric composition: Polyester Fiber 
Size: M,L,XL,2XL,3XL,4XL,5XL
Suitable season: Spring

 Note: 1. Asian sizes are 1 to 2 sizes smaller than European and
American people. Choose the larger size if your size between two
sizes. Please allow 2-3cm differences due to manual
measurement. 2. Please check the size chart carefully before you
buy the item, if you don't know how to choose size, please
contact our customer service. 3.As you know, the different
computers display colors differently, the color of the actual item
may vary slightly from the following images. Packing list:
 Coat+pants * 1 Product Image:       Comes with:


