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IXORA Daily Detox shampoo
will help you to start a safe hair
care journey with it’s powerful
combination of Clary Sage,
Rosemary essential oil,
Unpasteurized Raw Honey and
other powerful organic
ingredients. This powerful
formula removes build up
products and toxins from the
hair and balance the sebum
production of the scalp, thus
preventing the appearance of
dandruff within a short period of
time, IXORA Daily Detox
Shampoo also includes anti-hair
fall ingredients and even
stimulates hair growth.

Daily Detox Shampoo

Price per Unit $28,30

Price per Unit AED103.86

A unique Natural Dead sea Mud
Shampoo from Rivage with
Olive Oil that absorbs excess oil
revitalizes and moisturizes your
scalp and hair, Green Tea
strengthens your hair,
eliminates dandruff, and prevent
hair loss Vitamin E and Pro-
Vitamin B5 work together to
stimulate and hydrate hair
follicles, leaving your hair
cleansed and hydrated.

Suitable for all hair types

Natural Mud Shampoo | 250ml

Price per Unit $12,50

Price per Unit AED45.87

IXORA Nourishing Repair
Shampoo Gives life to your hair
and provide it with it’s essential
nutrition through the powerful
combination of Monoï de Tahiti,
Black Oats, Wheat Protein and
Coconut Alkanes. The
combination of these powerful
ingredients they help to deeply
nourish and gives back it’s
strength. This magic formula is
also rich of Lavender essential
oil, Geranium essential oil and
Unpasteurized Raw Honey to
protect, sooth the scalp and kill
bacteria that causes the hair to
be weak or break. Our
Nourishing Repair Shampoo
also includes anti-hair fall

Nourishing Repair Shampoo

Price per Unit $31,85

Price per Unit AED116.88

Thickens & Strengthens hair
roots. New formula enriched
with Biotin, Collagen,caffeine
and green tea extract. Helps
stimulate hair growth and
instantly thickens hair.

OXO hair fertilizing effect -
Enables deep absorption of
active ingredients into the scalp
and hair follicles

OXO Densifying Shampoo

Price per Unit $35,00

Price per Unit AED128.45
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Specific shampoo formulated for
dry, unmanageable or
chemically treatment hair. The
mix of moisturizing ingredients
leave your hair soft, clean,
restoring its elasticity and
adding shine and body.
Contains surfactants from plant
cell derivation

OXO Hair Repair Shampoo

Price per Unit $35,00

Price per Unit AED128.45

OXO Purifying Shampoo -
Professional hair cleansing.
Removes all residue completely
and reduces fumes before flat
iron use.

Designed specifically for OXO
Organic Permanent

Straightening Treatment. 

OXO Purifying Shampoo

Price per Unit $35,00

Price per Unit AED128.45

Detox Hair Serum has the
combination of Ginseng extract,
Clary sage,Tamanu Oil, Jojoba,
natural Vitamin E and other
powerful organic ingredients
that were specially formulated to
work as a detox Remedy for the
scalp. By massaging the serum
deeply into the scalp it removes
the build up products, balances
the scalp sebum production,
stimulates the synthesis of
natural hair keratin, increase B.
circulation around the hair
follicles and prevent hair loss
and stimulate its growth.

 

Detox Hair Serum

Price per Unit $37,15

Price per Unit AED136.34

Ideal protection against heat for
all hair types, leaving the hair
shiny and easy to comb

OXO Protein Hair Serum

Price per Unit $49,00

Price per Unit AED179.83
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A unique mix of the most
effective natural ingredients for
hair growth
and strength, The Ixora Hair
Treatment Oil deeply works its
way into all layers of the hair!
This powerful combination of
Natural Vitamin E, Organic
Argan Oil, Jojoba, Shea Butter
and Geranium Rose Essential
Oil help to deeply nourish,
hydrate and strengthen the hair
from its core leaving it shiny,
strong and silky smooth.

Hair Treatment Oil

Price per Unit $38,90

Price per Unit AED142.76

Set Including

Hair Repair Oil - 9 Ampoules

1 X Oxo Purifying Shampoo
400ml

1 X Oxo Hair Mask

1 X Hair Repair Shampoo 400
ml

OXO Active Oil Box

Price per Unit $399,00

Price per Unit AED1464.33

Absorbs deep into hair, scalp
and skin layers to regenerate
cells. Effective use in cases
treating loss of loss of shine,
color fading, hair breakage,
disorganization of hair structure,
burns, allergy, psoriasis,
dryness. Protect and nourishes
damaged hair during ironing
process

30ml Sufficient for 4-6
treatments

OXO Hair Repair Oil Ampoule

Price per Unit $49,00

Price per Unit AED179.83

Many factors can cause
damage and premature grey
hair as poor diet, heat of hair-
iron and frequent use of blow-
dryer. Ixora Hair Mask
concentrated with powerful
natural anti-oxidants to prevent
premature gray hair and reverse
it naturally with the power of
pomegranate seed oil, avocado
oil and Moroccan argan oil
which also helps to regenerate
hair cuticle layer, leaving your
hair shiny and silky.

Intensive Phyto Hair Mask

Price per Unit $42,50

Price per Unit AED155.97
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Keratin and plant based oils
formula for nourishment and
restoration of damaged, dry or
straightened hair

Recommended for all hair
types

•

Provide shine and leaves
the hair extra smooth

•

Contains 5% Active oil for
extra restoration

•

Long lasting sweet fragrance•
Leaves the hair with a light
and silky sensation

•

500 ml / oz 17•

OXO Hair Mask

Price per Unit $52,00

Price per Unit AED190.84

OXO Hair Fertilizer - Enables
deep absorption of active
ingredients into the scalp and
hair follicles

50 ml e | 1.69 fl.oz

New formula enriched with
Biotin, Collagen, Caffeine and
Green tea extract. Helps
Stimulate hair growth and
instantly thickens hair

OXO Professional Scalp Booster

Price per Unit $78,00

Price per Unit AED286.26

A unique natural Dead Sea Mud
rich with most curative minerals
combined carefully with the
well-known natural antiseptic
botanical Tea Tree Oil, acting
together to relieve scalp of
impurities, eliminate excessive
oils and to enhance oxygen
consumption for further
proliferation and eventually
removing dandruff.Scalp mud
combination brings general
relief from hair loss, itching
sensations, acute psoriases, to
reveal more healthy and
tightened scalp, thereby
preventing the weakening of
hair follicles.

Scalp Care Dead Sea Mud | 200ml

Price per Unit $20,50

Price per Unit AED75.23

This product provides shine,
smoothness, and hydration
balance to damaged hair,
restoring hydration balance,
protecting color, controlling frizz,
and enhancing lightness, all
enriched with Vitamin D and E.

5 fl.oz / 150 ml

OXO Keratin Spray

Price per Unit $43,00

Price per Unit AED157.81
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Silver Spray that offers Colour
Balancing, Tone solution,
Neutralizing blonde, Remove
yellow or orange tones from
bleached, blond or grey hair

5 fl.oz /150 ml

OXO Silver Spray

Price per Unit $43,00

Price per Unit AED157.81

OXO Organic is the only safe
smoothing treatment for hair
that provides a natural look. It
uses a low pH formula that does
not contain harsh chemicals
such as Formaldehyde and
glycolic Acid, Ammonia or
Sulfur, making it safe for all. The
product is applied to the hair,
100% shampooed out and then
ironed, eliminating the risk of
inhaling vapors or exposing the
hair to polluting chemicals
during the heating process.
OXO Organic transforms
coarse, frizzy, and curly hair to
smooth, straight, and shiny hair
while preserving the hair's
integrity. 

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing Treatment

Price per Unit $460,00

Price per Unit AED1688.20

OXO Organic is the only safe
smoothing treatment for hair
that provides a natural look. It
uses a low pH formula that does
not contain harsh chemicals
such as Formaldehyde and
glycolic Acid, Ammonia or
Sulfur, making it safe for all. The
product is applied to the hair,
100% shampooed out and then
ironed, eliminating the risk of
inhaling vapors or exposing the
hair to polluting chemicals
during the heating process.
OXO Organic transforms
coarse, frizzy, and curly hair to
smooth, straight, and shiny hair
while preserving the hair's
integrity.

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing Treatment Professional
Set

Price per Unit $689,00

Price per Unit AED2528.63

OXO Organic is the only safe
smoothing treatment for hair
that provides a natural look. It
uses a low pH formula that does
not contain harsh chemicals
such as Formaldehyde and
glycolic Acid, Ammonia or
Sulfur, making it safe for all. The
product is applied to the hair,
100% shampooed out and then
ironed, eliminating the risk of
inhaling vapors or exposing the
hair to polluting chemicals
during the heating process.
OXO Organic transforms
coarse, frizzy, and curly hair to
smooth, straight, and shiny hair
while preserving the hair's
integrity.

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing Treatment Set | Pre-
treatment Shampoo + Purifying Shampoo

Price per Unit $549,00

Price per Unit AED2014.83
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OXO Organic is the only safe
smoothing treatment for hair
that provides a natural look. It
uses a low pH formula that does
not contain harsh chemicals
such as Formaldehyde and
glycolic Acid, Ammonia or
Sulfur, making it safe for all. The
product is applied to the hair,
100% shampooed out and then
ironed, eliminating the risk of
inhaling vapors or exposing the
hair to polluting chemicals
during the heating process.
OXO Organic transforms
coarse, frizzy, and curly hair to
smooth, straight, and shiny hair
while preserving the hair's
integrity.

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing Treatment | Blonde
Edition

Price per Unit $389,00

Price per Unit AED1427.63

OXO Organic is the only safe
smoothing treatment for hair
that provides a natural look. It
uses a low pH formula that does
not contain harsh chemicals
such as Formaldehyde and
glycolic Acid, Ammonia or
Sulfur, making it safe for all. The
product is applied to the hair,
100% shampooed out and then
ironed, eliminating the risk of
inhaling vapors or exposing the
hair to polluting chemicals
during the heating process.
OXO Organic transforms
coarse, frizzy, and curly hair to
smooth, straight, and shiny hair
while preserving the hair's
integrity.

OXO Try Me Kit | Permanent Hair Smoothing Treatment

Price per Unit $169,00

Price per Unit AED620.23
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Name Price AED Price

Daily Detox Shampoo $28,30 AED103.86

Nourishing Repair Shampoo $31,85 AED116.88

Natural Mud Shampoo | 250ml $12,50 AED45.87

OXO Densifying Shampoo $35,00 AED128.45

OXO Hair Repair Shampoo $35,00 AED128.45

Detox Hair Serum $37,15 AED136.34

OXO Purifying Shampoo $35,00 AED128.45

OXO Protein Hair Serum $49,00 AED179.83

Hair Treatment Oil $38,90 AED142.76

OXO Hair Repair Oil Ampoule $49,00 AED179.83

OXO Active Oil Box $399,00 AED1464.33

Intensive Phyto Hair Mask $42,50 AED155.97
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Name Price AED Price

OXO Hair Mask $52,00 AED190.84

Scalp Care Dead Sea Mud | 200ml $20,50 AED75.23

OXO Professional Scalp Booster $78,00 AED286.26

OXO Keratin Spray $43,00 AED157.81

OXO Silver Spray $43,00 AED157.81

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing
Treatment Professional Set

$689,00 AED2528.63

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing
Treatment

$460,00 AED1688.20

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing
Treatment Set | Pre-treatment
Shampoo + Purifying Shampoo

$549,00 AED2014.83

OXO Permanent Hair Smoothing
Treatment | Blonde Edition

$389,00 AED1427.63

OXO Try Me Kit | Permanent Hair
Smoothing Treatment

$169,00 AED620.23


