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Briiv is a sustainable air purifier
made from elephant grass and
hemp, using three
biodegradable filters. These
filters filter air using natural
micro-structures of moss,
coconut, carbon, and silk. The
product uses less plastics than
other air purifiers and uses
smart engineering to power up
from a 5v USB connection. Briiv
is as powerful as 3,043
medium-sized houseplants,
capturing large particles and
fine particles.

Briiv Air Filter

Price per Unit $187,64

Price per Unit AED688.63

The Ava perfume diffuser finds
its balance in an oriental floral
composition. This tasty mixture
of bergamot, rose and vanilla
perfumes your interior with a
mysterious fragrance that is
reminiscent of the exoticism of a
trip to the East. Infinitely
sensual, the deep and warm
scents of this room fragrance fill
a need for escape.

Available in 200 ml.

Ava Diffuser

Price per Unit $47,60

Price per Unit AED174.69

Tender and intense, the Isadora
diffuser does not fear the non-
conformist elegance of the one
that inspired its fragrance. It
diffuses the envelopsing scents
of guaiac wood associated with
bergamot. This woody home
fragrance gives a glimpse in its
heart, the warm aromas of
cinnamon to bring an exotic
touch to your living space. At
every moment, Isadora
awakens the senses, arouses
emotion.

Available in 200 ml.

Isadora Diffuser

Price per Unit $47,60

Price per Unit AED174.69

In her wake of spicy leather,
Rita unleashes passions. The
fusion of its notes of raspberry,
jasmine and patchouli
celebrates love while the
intensity of its leather chords
reveals an enigmatic heart. This
gourmet and captivating
scented bouquet interferes in
every corner of your rooms for a
deeply sensual atmosphere.

200ml
 

Rita Diffuser

Price per Unit $47,60

Price per Unit AED174.69
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A fusion of unexpected notes
around a sublime ingredient:
bergamot, a precious citrus fruit,
combined with the power of iris
and patchouli. 

Spray - 100ml

Elsa Fabric Mist

Price per Unit $21,20

Price per Unit AED77.80

ISADORA room spray evokes
the beauty of a precious woody
fragrance. Captured in a glass
bottle with Art Deco lines, the air
exhales a delicate and elegant
fragrance.

Spray - 100ml

Isadora Room Spray

Price per Unit $21,20

Price per Unit AED77.80

Tamara, a warm, sensual spray
with amber notes, capturing the
essence of Lempicka's style
with top notes of saffron,
cardamom, orange, lingering
notes of  rose, cedar, jasmine,
patchouli, sandalwood and
vanilla.

Spray - 100ml

Tamara Room Spray

Price per Unit $21,20

Price per Unit AED77.80

Zelda room spray blends
Bergamot, Rose, Amber,
Sandalwood, Oakmoss, Cedar,
and Patchouli notes 

Spray - 100ml

Zelda Room Spray

Price per Unit $21,20

Price per Unit AED77.80
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Like a trip to the heart of the
East, the Ava scented candle
awakens the senses. This
oriental floral fragrance reveals
in its heart notes of saffron,
incense and rose that give it its
sensual personality. The
sweetness of vanilla embraces
the woody scents of cedar and
cashmere wood to wrap your
interior in a voluptuous trail. 

Burning time: 290g -  50 - 55
hours | 1KG - 150 hours

Ava Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61

A 250ml single cotton wick
candle, hand-poured in South
Africa using a soy wax blend
and imported perfume oils. The
candles are available in 5
fragrances, Black Gold, African
Storm, Clifton Beach, Safari
Days and Summer Vineyard,
each sale supports local non-
profits. The candles are
packaged in recyclable glass
and have a burning time of
approximately 35 hours.

Classic Scented Candle

Price per Unit $12,00

Price per Unit AED44.04

In its delicately tinted glass, the
Elsa scented candle reveals a
mosaic of tangy and flowery
scents sublimated by a precious
ingredient: bergamot. Combined
with the mesmerising smell of
lilac and patchouli, this citrus
cocktail evokes the freshness of
Italian coasts from the first
seconds. A remarkable
fragrance that fills the interior
with an invigorating atmosphere
in which we like to recharge our
batteries for 55 hours.

Available in: 290g.

Elsa Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61

With its woody accords, the
scented candle Isadora
embodies grace and lightness.
This subtle mixture between
bergamot, grey amber and
guaiac wood recalls the
elegance of a precious wood.
The tenderness of its scents
come to caress your interior in a
sparkling atmosphere. In its soft
brightness, this candle
expresses the beauty of luxury.

Burning time: 290g -  50 - 55
hours | 1KG - 150 hours

Isadora Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61
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A large 500ml triple cotton wick
candle, hand-poured in South
Africa using a soy wax blend
and imported perfume oils,
packaged in a dramatically
embellished box. The candles
are available in 5 fragrances,
Black Gold, African Storm,
Clifton Beach, Safari Days and
Summer Vineyard, each sale
supports local non-profits. The
candles are packaged in
recyclable glass and have a
burning time of approximately
55 hours.

Large Scented Candle

Price per Unit $20,00

Price per Unit AED73.40

A cute but classy mini 100ml
candle with cotton wick candle,
hand-poured in South Africa
using a soy wax blend and
imported perfume oils. The
candles are available in 5
fragrances, Black Gold, African
Storm, Clifton Beach, Safari
Days and Summer Vineyard,
each sale supports local non-
profits. The candles are
packaged in recyclable glass
and have a burning time of
approximately 12 hours.

Mini Scented Candle

Price per Unit $5,75

Price per Unit AED21.10

Sultry and intoxicating, this
scent captures the essence of
New Orleans. The base note of
toasted oak evokes aging
whiskey barrels, while subtle
aromas of herbaceous bitters
and Cajun spices lend
additional layers of richness.

Approximate burn time:  8 oz:
50 hours

No. 0324 Aging Spirits Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

This clean and comforting scent
balances the fresh green notes
of the aerangis orchid with its
pure white florals, while
underlying notes of musk and
sandalwood wrap the fragrance
with a softness and warmth like
that of a cozy cashmere
blanket.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 1 The Beginning Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13
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Fresh and aromatic, and with
notes of unripe cassis, tender
green leaves, and garden
herbs, this leafy scent captures
the verdant fragrance of the
vineyard in summertime after a
fresh rain. Flinty hints of
mineral-rich soil balance the
scent’s bracing freshness, while
its sandalwood base teases out
warmth and depth.  

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No.10 A Hundred & Fifteen Rows Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

An homage to our favorite time
of year in our favorite city, this
scent encapsulates the essence
of the holidays in New York
City. Balsam and suede evoke
fresh-cut fir trees, bespeckled
with powdery snow, for sale
along bustling sidewalks, while
aromatics, light citrus, and
cedarwood conjure up
Champagne cocktails, festive
food, and that contagious
merriment among friends and
family—all against the backdrop
of the City’s unmistakable, and
unrivaled, silver skyline.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 102 Silver Skyline Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

Edgy, yet welcoming, this scent
captures the sensory
contradictions of midtown
Manhattan on a wet fall day.
Petrichor, minerality and bright
bergamot elicit New York City’s
damp concrete and sharp
skyline facades of granite and
steel, while hyacinth, musk, and
cedar provide a counteracting
softness and warmth
reminiscent of freshly prepared
bouquets at the neighborhood
bodega.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

 

No. 212 Concrete Jungle Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

Warm, inviting, and a little spicy,
this scent envelopes your home
with notes of pipe tobacco, aged
leather, and old books. Hints of
green cypress and pepper
provide a contrasting, airy
freshness similar to a blast of
fresh country air.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 2598 The Ranch Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13
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This blend of sweet citrus and
orange blossom celebrates the
sensual pleasures of Morocco.
Sun-blushed mandarin mingles
with jasmine, rose petals, and
neroli for top notes, as warm
amber and patchouli define its
base.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 26 Lost in the Souk Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

Warm and intimate, this
grounding fragrance captures
the romance of an old-world
antique bookstore. Earthy
aromas of sandalwood and
saffron combine with an
ephemeral whisper of powdery
rose and patchouli to evoke the
scents of aging paper, while
smoky birch resin layers on
notes of leather and dried ink.  

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 40 Livraria Antiga Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

Our latest bespoke fragrance,
specifically created for a black-
tie celebration in New York
City. A combination of floral,
wood, and musk notes. This
gender-neutral scent with
Cashmere wood and subdued
musk ground this fragrance in
warmth while top notes of black
cassis and lemon twist
contribute a vibrant freshness.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours 

No. 50 Soiree Noire

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

This calming fragrance
balances green notes of pine
and eucalyptus with a hint of
ceremonial incense. As the wax
melts, it gives way to underlying
notes of oolong tea, fresh
geranium and earthy moss
which recall a peaceful garden
at dawn.

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 51 Secret Garden Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13



 

Prices may change depending on quantities ordered. Shipping costs are not included and will be quoted separately.

8

Velvety and sensual, this floral
fragrance captures the essence
of orange jasmine with notes of
white gardenia, silky musk, and
citrus blossoms. Ylang ylang
and hints of sticky nectar meld
together as the candle burns,
evoking memories of Taiwan’s
tropical humid evenings. 

Approximate Burn Time: 8 oz.:
50 hours

No. 7 Seven Miles Candle

Price per Unit $39,00

Price per Unit AED143.13

Combined with gourmet notes
of raspberry and intoxicating
essences of jasmine, the spicy
freshness of cardamom gives
the Rita candle an exhilarating
fragrance. A precious
background of patchouli and
cedar punctuates this fragrance
of character in a mesmerizing
atmosphere.

Burning time: 290g -  50 - 55
hours | 1KG - 150 hours

Rita Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61

This fragrant candle, adorned
with a pewter label, is a
decorative item and perfume,
blending top notes of saffron,
cardamom, orange, middle
notes of rose, and base notes of
patchouli, Musk, and
sandalwood.

290g | Burning time: 50-55
hours

Tamara Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61

The perfect combination of 3x
90g mini scented candles.
Ava: Top notes top notes:
bergamot, peach,Heart notes
hand notes: saffron, incense,
pink, base notes: vanilla, cedar,
cashmere wood
Rita: Top notes: raspberry,
cardamom,Heart notes: leather,
jasmine, iris, Base notes: foam,
amber, patchouli, cedar
Isadora: Top notes: bergamot,
cloves, Heart notes: Amber,
Cinnamon, Vanilla, Base notes:
guaiac, sandalwood, patchouli,
musk

Trio of Mini Candles

Price per Unit $31,90

Price per Unit AED117.07
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This fragrant candle, adorned
with a pewter label, is a
decorative and perfumed item,
blending Bergamot, Rose,
Amber, Sandalwood, Oakmoss,
Cedar, and Patchouli notes.

290g | Burning time: 50-
55 hours.

Zelda Scented Candle

Price per Unit $23,60

Price per Unit AED86.61

The Bugaia glass bell, crafted
from hand-blown, hot-cut glass,
protects 290 g Bugaia scented
candles, preserving their scents
and enhancing the beauty of
your interior.

Bugaia Glass Bell

Price per Unit $17,00

Price per Unit AED62.39

This set includes both a wick
trimmer, helping to keep the
wicks of your favorite Aerangis
candles trimmed, resulting in a
cleaner and more pure burn,
plus a candle snuffer, allowing
you to extinguish your candle's
flame while preserving its future
burning quality and life. Made
entirely from stainless steel,
both tools come in a sustainably
sourced cotton bag for easy
storage.

 

Candle Care Set

Price per Unit $25,00

Price per Unit AED91.75

This stainless-steel snuffer
helps extinguish your candle in
style. A beautiful accessory to
keep close by, this tool safely
snuffs out your candle while
keeping its wick and hot wax
intact, resulting in a longer
candle life. Includes a
sustainably sourced custom
cotton bag for storage.

Candle Snuffer

Price per Unit $14,00

Price per Unit AED51.38
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This stainless-steel tool helps
keep your candle wick neatly
trimmed before each burn,
reducing soot and smoke so
that the candle burns cleanly
and maintains its true scent.
The tool conveniently captures
any excess wick as you trim, so
it can be easily
discarded without a mess.

Candle Wick Trimmer

Price per Unit $14,00

Price per Unit AED51.38

Beautifully presented Bugaia
Box of matches

Large size about 120 matches.

Matches

Price per Unit $5,50

Price per Unit AED20.18
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AIR PURIFIERS & SCENTS 

Name Price AED Price

Briiv Air Filter US$187.64 AED688.63

Isadora Diffuser US$47.60 AED174.69

Ava Diffuser US$47.60 AED174.69

Rita Diffuser US$47.60 AED174.69

Elsa Fabric Mist US$21.20 AED77.80

Tamara Room Spray US$21.20 AED77.80

Isadora Room Spray US$21.20 AED77.80

Zelda Room Spray US$21.20 AED77.80

Ava Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61

Elsa Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61

Classic Scented Candle US$12.00 AED44.04

Isadora Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61
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Name Price AED Price

Large Scented Candle US$20.00 AED73.40

No. 0324 Aging Spirits Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

Mini Scented Candle US$5.75 AED21.10

No. 1 The Beginning Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No.10 A Hundred & Fifteen Rows
Candle

US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 212 Concrete Jungle Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 102 Silver Skyline Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 2598 The Ranch Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 26 Lost in the Souk Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 50 Soiree Noire US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 40 Livraria Antiga Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

No. 51 Secret Garden Candle US$39.00 AED143.13
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Name Price AED Price

No. 7 Seven Miles Candle US$39.00 AED143.13

Tamara Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61

Rita Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61

Trio of Mini Candles US$31.90 AED117.07

Zelda Scented Candle US$23.60 AED86.61

Candle Care Set US$25.00 AED91.75

Bugaia Glass Bell US$17.00 AED62.39

Candle Snuffer US$14.00 AED51.38

Candle Wick Trimmer US$14.00 AED51.38

Matches US$5.50 AED20.18


